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Department of Transportation
CTVIL AVIATION AUTHORITY OF THE PHILIPPNIES
ffice of thc Dirutor Genssl

MEMORANDUM CIRCI-ILAR NO.: c15-U

TO : ALLCONCERNED

FROM : THE ACTING DIRECTOR GENERAL

SUBIECT AMENDMENT TO PHILIPPINE CIVIL AVIATION
REGULATTONS ArR NAVTGATTON SERVTCES (CAR-ANS)
PART II INCORPORATING AT4ENDMENT 5OA AND 5OB TO
ICAO AI\NEX I I

REFERENCE:

1. Philippine Civil Aviation Regulations- Air Navigation Services
2. ICAO Annex 11

3. ICAO Annex I l; Amendment 50A and 50B
4. Regulations Amendment Procedures
5. Board Resolution No. 2012-054 dated 28 September 2012

Pursuant to the powers vested in me under the Republic Act 9497, otherwise known as the
Civil Aviation Authority Act of 2008 and in accordance with the Board Resolution No.: 2012-
054 dated 28 September 2012, I hereby approve the incorporation of ICAO Annex l1
Amendment No. 50A and 508 to the Philippine Civil Aviation Regulations - Air Navigation
Services (CAR-ANS) Part 11.

ORIGINAL REGULATION:

CAR-ANS Part 11

PART I1.1_DEFINITIONS

Altemate uerodrome. An aerodrome to which an aircraft may proceed when it becomes either
impossible or inadvisable to proceed to or to land at the aerodrome of intended landing.
Altemate aerodromes include the following:

Tahe-aff ahemate An alternate aerodrome at which an aircraft can land should this become
necessary shortly after take-offand it is not possible to use the aerodrome of departure.

En-route alternate. An aerodrome at which an aircraft would be able to land after experiencing
an abnormal or emergency condition while en route.

ETOPS en-toutc alternate. A suitable and appropriate alternate aerodrome at which an
aeroplane would be able to land after experiencing an engine sn'ut down or other abnormal or
emergency condition while en route in an ETOPS operation.
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Destination allernate. An alternate aerodrome to which an aircraft may proceed should it
become either irnpossible or inadvisable to land at the aerodrome of intended landing.

Note. - The aerodrome from which a Jlight departs may olso be an en-route or o destination
alte rnate ae rodrome .for that fl i ght.

Approprinte AN authorily. The relevant authority designated by the State responsible for
providing air traffEc services in the airspace concemed.

Controllcd airspoce. An airspace of defined dimensions within which air traffic control service
is provided in accordance with the airspace classification.

Nate. - Controlled airspace i:; a generic term which covers ATS airspace Classe.s A, B, C, D
and E as described in 2.6.

Data qaalily. A degree or level of confidence that the data provided meets the requirements of
the data user in terms of accuracy, resolution and integrity.

Incident An occurrence, other than an accident, associated with the operation of an aircraft
which affects or could affect the safety of operation.

Note. - The gpes of incidents which are of main interest to the International Civil Aviation
Organizationfor accident prevention srudies are iisteci in Annex 13, Auachment C.

Obstocle. All fixed (whether temporary or pennanent) and mobile objects, or parts thereof, that
are located on an area intended for the surface movement of aircraft or that extend above a
defined surface intended to protect aircraft in flight.

Operutor. A person, organization or enterprise engaged in or offering to engage in an aircraft
operation.

Performonce-based navigatton PBfr\. Area navigation based on performance requirements
for aircraft operating along an ATS route, on an instrument approach procedure or in a

designated airspace.

Note.- Per/brmance requiremenls are expressed in navigation speciJicalions (RNAV
specification, RNP specification) in terms of accuracy, integrity, contirutity, cwailability and

functionality needed.fitr the proytsecl operotion in the context of a particalctr airspace utncept.

Radiotelephony. A form of radio communication primarily intended for the exchange of
information in the form of speech.

RCP type. A label (e.g. RCP 240) that represents the values assigned to RCP parameters for
communication ftansaction time, continuity, availability and integrity.
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Reporling poinl A specif,ed geographical location in relation to which the position of an
aircraft can be reported.

Required communieationperform*nce (RCP) A statement of the perfonnance requirements
for operational communication in support of specific ATM fimctions.

SIGMET inform*tion Information issued by a meteorological watch office concerning the
orcuffence or expmtd occumence of specified en-route weather phenomena which that may
affect the safety ofaircraft operations.

Specful VFRfiight. A VFR flight cleared by air traffic control to operate within a control zone
in meteorological conditions below YMC.

11.2 GENERAL

11.2.7 Performanceba sed navigation (PBN) operations

11.2.7.2 Tire presuibed riavigaiion specifisaiiort shall be appropriatc io ihE level of
communications, navigation and air traffic services provided in the airspace concerned.

I 1.2.8 Requi red comm unication performance (RCP)

rr^ol n^nL-----t--tl 1--------il--aL--^ llD tlfl-^-^^--ti-^Ll- rl-^nnnL.-^/^\ -1-^I1 l-^t t.L.6.l Il'Lr rypss silarr us prEsulrutru uy \-Afrr. vvilsil aplJiluaurgr urs r\Lr rylrE(s/ slrillr utr

prescribed on the basis of regional air navigation agreements.

11.2.8.2 The prescribed RCP type shall be appropriate to the air traffic services provided in the
airspace concerned.

11.2.9 Establishment and designation of the units providing air traffic services

The air traffic services shall be provided by units established and designated as follows:

11.2.9.1 Flight infounation centers shall be established to provide flight information serv'ice

and alerting service within flight infonnation regions, and shall be publislted in the
Aeronautical Information Publication (AIP).

Note.- This does not preclude delegating to ather units the function af providing certain
^ I ^.-- ^.^t- --t tI-^ /l:-I^t :-^/)-*- -r:--.^ -.,-^.:^^ctcrtrcttlJ uJ ute JttEttt ,tuur riluttur, iet vtLc,

11,.2.9.2 Air traffic control units shall be estatllished to provide air traffic control service, flight
information service and alerting service within conffol areas, control zones and at controlled
aerodromes, and shall be published in the AIP.

Note. - The services to be provided by various air lrffic control units are indicated in 3.2.
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11.2.10 Specifications for flight information regions, control areas and control zones.

I 1 .2. 1 0. I The delineafion of airspace, wherein air traffic services are to be provided, should he
related to the nature of the route structure and the need for efficient service rather than to
national boundaries.

Note l.- Agreements to permit the delineation of airspace lying across national boundaries ore
afuisable when such actionwillfocilitate the provision of air lrafiic services (see ll.2.l.l).
Agreements which permit delineation of airspace boundaries by staight lines will, .for
example, be most convenient where data processing techniques ore used by air trffic services
unit.s.

Note 2.- Where delineation of airspace is made by reference to national boundaries lhere is a
needfur suilably sited tranqfer points to be mutually agreed upon.

11.2.10.2 Manila Flight Information Region

11.2.10.2.1The Manila Flight Information Region covers the whole of &e air route structure
including all airspaces within its lateral limits.

1 1.2.10.3 Control Areas

11.2.10.3.1 Control areas including, inter alia, airways and terminal control areas shall be
delineated so as to encompass sufficient airspace to contain the flight paths of those IFR flights
or portions thereof to which it is desired to provide the applicable parts of the air traffic conffol
service, taking into account the capabilities of the navigation aids normally used in that area.

Note.- In a control area other than one./brmed by a system of'airways, a syslem oJ'routes may
be established to.facilitate the provision of air trffic cantrol.

ii.2.i0.3.2 A iower iimit oia control area shaii be estabiished at a height above the ground or
water of not less than 200 m (700 ft).

11.2.143.2.1 The lower limit of a control area should, when practicable and desirable in order
to allow freedom of action for VFR flights below the control area, be established at a greater
height than the minimurn specified in I1.2.10.3.2.

11.2.10.3.2.2 When the lower limit of a contol area is above 900 m (3 000 ft) MSL it should
coincide with a VFR cruising level.

11.2.10.3.3 An upper limit of a control area shall be established when either:

a) air traffic control service will not be provided above such upper limit; or

b) the control area is situated below an upper control area, in which case the upper limit shall
coincide with the lower limit of the upper control area.

c) '*iren established, such upper limit shall coincide with the table of VFR cruising levels in
CARPart 8.
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11.2.10.4.1 The lateral limits of control zones shall encompass at least those portions of the
airspace, which are not within control areas, containing the paths of IFR flights arriving at and
departing from aerodromes to be used under instrument meteorological conditions.

Note.-Aircraft holding in lhe vicinity of aerodromes ore considered as aniving aircrafl,

11.2.10.4.2 The lateral limits of a conffol zone shall extend to at least 9.3 km (5 NM) from the
centre of the aerodrome or aerodromes concerned in the directions from which approaches may
be made.

Note.-A control zone may include two or more aerodrome,s siluated cl()se together.

11.2.10.4.3If a control zone is located within the lateral limits of a control area, it shall extend
upwards from the surface of the earth to at least the lower limit of the control area.

Note- An upper limit higher than the lower limit of the overlying control area may be
e stablished when desired.

11.2.10.4.4If a control zone is located outside of the lateral limits of a conuol area, an upper
limit should be established.

11.2.10.4.5If it is desired to establish the upper lirnit of a control zone at a level higher than

the lower limit of the control area established above it, or if the contol zone is located outside
of the lateral limits of a control area- its upper limit should be established at a level which can

easily be identified by pilots. When this limit is above 900 m (3 000 ft) MSL it should coincide
with the VFR cruising level of the tables as published in the Philippine AIP.

Note.-- This implies thot, if xsed, the selected VFR cruising level be such that expected local
atmospheric pressure variations do rutt result in a lowering of this limit to a height of'less lhan
2A0 m 000 fA above ground orwoter.

ll.2.ll ldentification of air traffic seruice units and airspaces

Il.2.ll.l An area control centre or flight information centre should be identified by the name

of a nearby town or cit-v or geographic feature.

11.2.11.2 An aerodrome control tower or approach control unit shotrld be identified by the
narne of the aerodrome at which it is located.

11.2.11.3 A contol zone, control area or flight information region should be identified by the
name of the unit having jurisdiction over such airspace.

lL.2.l2 Bstablishment and identification of ATS routes

ll.2.l2.l When ATS routes are established, a protected airspace along each ATS route and a
safe spacing between adjacent ATS routes shall be provided.

11.2.12.2 When warranted by density, complexity or natu.re of the traffic, special routes should
be established for use by low-level trafffic, including helicopters operating to and from
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helidecks on the high seas. When detennining the lateral spacing between such routes, ac,count
should be taken of the navigational means available and the navigation equipment carried on
board helicopters.

11.2.12.3 ATS routes shall be identified by designators.

11,.2.12.4 Designators for ATS routes other than standard departure and arrival routes shall be
selected in accordance with the principles set forth in Appendix I l.l.
11.2.12.5 Standard deparhre and arrival routes and associated procedures shall be identified in
accordance with the principles set forth in Appendix 11.3.

Note I.- Guidnnce maleial relating to the establishment of ATS roules is contained in the Air
Trffic Serttices Planning Mamtal (Doc 9426).

Nole 2.- Guidonce material relaling to the establishment ofAN routes deJined by VOR is
contained in Attachment A.

Note 3.- The spacing between parallel tracks or between pamllel ATS route center lines based
on pedormance-based ruwigationwill be dependent upon the relevant navigation specification
required.

11.2.13 Establishment of change-over points

11.2.13.1 Change-over points should be established on ATS route segments defined by
reference to very high frequency omnidirectional radio ranges where this will assist accurate
navigation along the route segments. The establishment of change- over points should be
limited to route segments of 1 l0 km (60 NM) or more, except where the complexity of ATS
routes, the density of navigation aids or cther technical and operational reasons warrant the
establishment of change-over points on shorter route segments.

11.2.13.2 Unless otherwise established in relation to the performance of the navigation aids or
frequenry protection criteria, the change-over point on a route segment should be the mid-point
between the facilities in the case of a straight route segment or the intersection of radials in the
case of a route segment which changes direction between the facilities.

Note.- Guidance on the estahlishment o/'change-over poinls is conlained in Attachment A.

Ll.2.l4 Establishment and identification of siguilicant points

11.2.14.1, Significant points shall be established for the purpose of defining an ATS route or
instrument approach procedure and/or in relation to the requirements of air fraffic services for
information regarding the progress of aircraft in flight.

11.2.14.2 Significant points shall be identified by designators.

11.2.14.3 Significant points shall be established and identifled in accordance with the
principles set forth in Appendix 11.2.

11.2.15 Establishment and identification of standard routes for taxiing aircraft

11.2.15.1 Where necessary, standard routes for tading aircraft should be established on an
aerodrome between nmways, aprons and maintenance areas. Such routes should be direct,
simple and where practicable, designed to avoid traffic conflicts.
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11.2.15.2 Standard routes for taxiing aircraft should be identified by designators distinctively
different from those ofthe runways and ATS routes.

11.2.16 Coordination between the operator and air trafric services

ll.2.16.l Air traffic services units, in carrying out their objectives, shall have due regard for
the requirements of the operators consequent on their obligations, and, if so required by the
operators, shall make available to them or their designated representatives such information as

may be available to enable them or their designated representatives to carry out their
responsibilities.

11.2.16.2 When so requested by an operator, messages (including position reports) received by
air traffic services units and relating to the operation of the aircraft for which operational
confrol service is provided by that operator shall, so far as practicable, be made available
immediately to the operator or a designated representative in accordance with locally agreed
procedures.

11.2.17 Coordination between military authorities and air traIfic services

Il.2.l7.l Air traffic services authorities shall establish and maintain close cooperation with
military authorities responsible for activities that may affect fliglrts of civil aircraft.

1L.2.17.2 Coordination of activities potentially hazardous to civil aircraft shall be effected in
accordance with I 1.2. 18.

11.2.17.3 Arrangernents shall be made to permit information relevant to the safe and
expeditious conduct of flights of civil aircraft to be promptly exchanged between air traffic
services units and appropriate military units.

11.2.17.3.1Air traffic services units shall, either routinely or on request, in accordance with
locally agreed procedures, provide appropriate rnilitary units with pertinent flight plan and
other data concerning flights of civil aircraft. In order to eliminate or reduce the need for
interceptions, air traffic services authorities shall designate any areas or routes where the
requirements of CAR Part 8 conceming flight plans, fwo-way communications and position
reporting apply to alt llights to ersure that 'a17 perl.futen[ data is available in appropriate air
raffic services units specifically for the purpose of facilitating identification of civil aircraft.

ll.2.l7 .3.2 Special procedures shall be established in order to ensure that:

a) air traffic services units are notified if a militar_y unit observes that an aircraft which is, or
might be, a civil aircraft is approaching, or has entered, any area in which interception might
become necessary;

b) all possible efforts are made to confirm the identity of the aircraft and to provide it with the
navigational guidance necessary to avoid the need for interception.

1,1.2.18 Coordination of activities potentialty hazardous to civil aircraft



11.2.18.1 The arrangements for activities potentially hazardous to civil aircraft, whether over
the territory of a State or over the high seas, shall be coordinated wittr the appropriate air traffic
services aurhorities. The crxrdination shall be effected early enough to permit timely
promulgation of information regarding the activities in accordance with the provisions of
CAR-ANS Part 15.

11.2.18.1.1 If the appropriate ATS authority is not that of the State where the organization
planning the activities is located, initial coordination should be effected through the ATS
authority responsible for the airspace over the State where the organization is located.

11.2.18.2 The objective of the coordination shall be to achieve the best arrangements which
will avoid hazards to civil aircraft and minimize interference with the normal operations of
such aircraft.

11..2.L8.2.1In detennining these arrangements the following should be applied:

a) the locations or areas, times and durations for the activities should be selected to avoid
closure or realignment of established ATS routes, blocking of the most economic flight levels,
or delays ofscheduled aircraft operations, unless no other options exist;

b) the size of the airspace designated for the conduct of the activities should be kept as small as

possible;

c) direct communication between the appropriate ATS authority or air traffic services unit and
the organization or unit conducting the activities should be providal for rme in the event t}af
civil aircraft emergencies or other unforeseen ckcumstances require discontinuation of the
activities.

11.2.18.3 The appropriate ATS authorities shall be responsible for initiating the promulgation
of information regarding the activities.

11.2.18.4 If activities potentially hazardous to civil aircraft take place on a regular or
continuing basis, special committees should be established as required to ensure that the
requirements ofall parties concerned are adequately cmrdinated.

11.2.18.5 Adequate steps shall be taken to prevent emission of laser beams from adversehr
affecting flight operations.

1 I .2. 18.6 In order to provide added airspace capacrty and to improve efficiency and flexibility
of aircraft operations, CAAP should establish procedwes providing for a flexible use of
airspace reserved for military or other special activities. The procedures should permit all
airspace users to have safe access to such reserved airspace.

11.2.19 Aeronautical data

ll.2.I9.l Determination and reporring of air traffic services-related aeronautical data shall be

in accordance with the accr-r-raey and integnty requireme-nts set forth in Tables 1 to 5 contained

in Appendix 5 while taking into account the established quality system procedures. Accuracy
requirements for aeronautical data are based upon a 95 per cent confidence level, and in that
respect three ffpes of positional data shall be identified: surveyed points (e.g. navigation aids
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positions), calculated points (mathernatical calculations from the known surveyed points of
points in space, fixes) and declared points (e.g. flight information region boundary points).

I I .2 . 19 .2 The CAAP shall ensure that integuty of aeronauti cal data is marntamed throughout
the data process from survey/orign to the next intended user. Based on the applicable integrity
classifi cation, the validation procedure shall:

11.2.19.3 Electronic aeronautical data sets, shall be protected by the inclusion in the data sets
of a 32-bit cyclic redundancy check (CRC) implemented by the application dealing with the
data sets. This shall apply to the protection of all integrity levels of data sets as specified in
2.19.2.

11.2.19.4 To achieve protection of the integnty level of routine aeronautical data as classified
in11.2.19.2, a 16-bit CRC aigorithm should apply.

Note. - Guidance mateiol on the aeronaulical data quolity requirements (accaracy, resolution,
integrity, protection and traceability) is contained in the World Geodetic System - 1984
(WGS-84) Manual (Doc 9674). Supporting malerial in respect oJ'the provisions of Appendix 5
related to accuracy and integrity of aeronautical data is contained in RTCA Document DO-
201A arui European Organization.for Civil Aviation Equipment @L\ROCAE) Document ED-
7 7 -- Indu st ry Re qu i re m e n t s fo r Ae ro naut i c a I Info rm o t i on.

11.2.19.5 Geographical coordinates indicating latitude and longitude shall be determined and
reported to the aeronautical information services authoriy in terms of the World Geodetic
System - 7984 (WGS-84) geodetic reference datum, identif,ring those geographical

coordinates which have been fransformed into WGS-84 coordinates by mathematical means
and whose accuracy of original field work does not meet the requirements in fupendix I L5,
Table l.

11 .2.19.6 The order of accuracy of the field work and determinations and calculations derived
therefrom shall be such that the resulting operational navigation data for the phases of flight
will be within the maximum deviations, with respect to an appropriate reference frame, as

indicated in the tables contained in Appendix 5.

Note l.- An appropriate reference _frame is that which enables WGS-84 to be realized on a
given position arul with respect lo which all coordinale data are related.

Note 2.- Specifications governing the publicotion of aeronautical data are given in CAR-ANS
Part 15, 11.3.

Note 3.- For lhose./ixes and points that are serving a dual purpose, e.g. holding point and
missed approach point, the higher accuracy applies.

11.2,2O Coorelination between meteorological and air trallic services authorities
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11.2.20.1 To enstre that aircraft receive the most up-to-date meteorological information for
aircraft operations, arrangements shall be made, where necessary, between meteorological and
air traffic services authorities for air ffaffic services nersonnel:

a) in addition to using indicating instruments, to report, if observed by air ffaffic services
personnel or communicated by aircraft, such other meteorological elements as may be agreed
upon;

b) to report as soon as possibie to the associated meteorologicai office meteorological
phenomena of operational significance, if observed by air traffic services personnel or
communicated by aircraft, which have not been included in the aerodrome meteorological
report;

c) to report as soon as possible to the associated meteorological office pertinent infonnation
concerning pre-eruption volcanic activity, volcanic eruptions and information concerning
volcanic ash cloud. In addition, area control centers and fliglrt information centers shall report
the information to the associated meteorological watch office and volcanic ash advisory centers
(VAACS).

11.2.20.2 Close coordination shall be maintained between a.rea control centers, flight
information c€nters and associated meteorological watch offices to ensure that information on
volcanic ash included in NOTAM and SIGMET messages is consistent.

11.2.21Coordination between aeronautical information services and air tralfic services
authorities

ll.2.2l.l To ensure that aerornutical information services units obtain information to enable

them to provide up-to-date pre-flight information and to meet the need for in- flight
inforrnation, arrangements shall be made between aeronautical information services and air
traffic services authorities responsible for air traffic services to report to the responsible
aeronautical information services unit, with a minimum of deiay:

a) information on aerodrome conditions;

b) the operational satus of associated facilities, services and navigation aids within their area

of responsibility:

c) the occutrence of volcanic activity observed by air traffic services personnel or reported by
aircraft; and

d) any other information considered to be of operational significance.

11.2.21.2 Before introducing changes to the air navigation system, due account shall be taken
by the seryices responsible for such changes of the tirne needed by the aeronautical information
service for the preparation, production and issuance of relevant material for promulgation. To
ensure timely provision of the information to the aeronautical information service, close

coordination betwEen those services concerned is therefore requirtxl.

11.2.21.3 Of particular importance are changes to aeronautical information that affect charts

andlor computer-based navigation systems which qualify to be notified by the Aeronautical

10



Information Regulation and Control (AIRAC) system, as specified in CAR-ANS Part 15,

11.11. 6 and Appendix 11.4). The predetermined, internationally agreed AIRAC effective dates

in addition to 14 days postage time shall be observed hy the responsible air traffic services

when submitting the raw information/data to aeronautical information services.

11.2.21.4 The air traffic services responsible for the provision of raw aeronautical

information/data to the aeronautical information services shall do so while taking into account

accuracy and integrity requirernants for aeronautical data as specified in Appendix 5 to this

CAR-ANS Part 11.

Note l.- SpeciJications for the issue oJ' a NOTAM and ASHTAM are contained in CAR-ANS
Part 15, ll.5).

Note 2.- Reports of volcanic activity comprise the information tletailed in CAR-ANS Part 3, I I
4 and LOA omong Phivolcs, Pagasa, & CAAP.

Note 3.- AIRAC inlbrmation is dislribuled by the aeretnaulical informalion semice at least 42

da-ts in advance of the AIRA{: eJfeclive dntes with the objective of'reaching recipients at least

28 days in advance oJ'the ffictive date.

11.2.22 Minimum flight altitudes

Minimum flight altitudes shall be determined and promulgated by CAAP for each ATS route
and control area over its territory. The minimum flight altitudes determined shall provide a
minimum clearance above the controlling obstacle located within the areas concerned.

Note.- The requirementsfor pthlication hy CAAP regarding minimumJlight ahitudes and
criteriaused to determine them are contained in CAR-ANS Part 15, Appendix I.

11.2.23 Service to aircraft in the event of an emergency

11.2.23.1 An aircraft known or believed to be in a state of emergency, including being
subjected to unlawful interference, shall be given maximum consideration, assistance and
priority over other aircraft as may be necessitated by the circumstances.

Note.- To indicale that it is in a slate oJ'emergency, on aircraft equipped with an appropriate
datalink capability and'ar SSR transponder might operate the equipment as.follows:

a) on Mode A, Code 7700: or

b) on Mode ,4, Code 7500, to indicate spectfically that it is being subjected to unlav,ful

interference; ond/or

c) activate the appropriale emergency and/or urgenqt capahility of ADS-B or ADS-C; and/or

d) transmit the appropriate emerg{ency message via CPDLC.

11.2.23.1.1 In communications between ATS units and aircraft in the event of an emergency,

Htrnan Factors principles shotrld be observed.
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11.2.23.2 When an occurrence of unlawful interference with an aircraft takes place or is
suspected, ATS units shall attend promptly to requests by the aircraft. Information pertinent to
the safe conduct of the flight shall confinue to be transmitted and necessary action shall be

taken to expedite the conduct of all phases of the flight, especially the safe landing of the
aircraft.

11.2.23.3 When an occlurence of unlawful interference with an aircraft takes place or is
suspected, ATS units shall, in accordance with locally agreed procedures, immediately inform
the appropriate authority designated by CAAP and exchange necessary information with the
operator or its designated representative.

Note.- A strayed or unidentified aircrali may be wspected as being the subject of unlawful
intederence.

11.2.24 In-fl ight contingencies

11.2.24.1 Strayed or turidentified aircraft

Note l.- The terms "strqved aircrafi" and "unidenti.fied aircraft" in this paragraph hove the

following meanings:

Strayed aircraft. An aircrafi which has deviated significantly Jrom its inlended track or which
reports that it is lost.

(lnidentifted aircraft. An aircraft which has been observed or reported lo be operating in a
given area but who.se identity ha.; not been establisircd.

Note 2.- An aircraft may be considered, at the same time, as a "slrayed aircraJi" by one unit
and as an "unitlentiJied aircraJi" by another unit.

11.2.24.1.1As soon as an air traffic services unit becomes aware of a strayed aircraft it shall

take all necessary steps as outlined n 11.2.23.1.1.1 and 11.2.23.1.1.2 to assist the aircraft and

to safeguard its flight.

Note.- Navigotional assistance by an air trafic services unit is particularly important if the

unit becomes oware of an aircraft straying, or obaut to stray, into on area where there is a risk
of interceplion or other hazard lo its sa/bty.

ll.?.24.1.1.1 If the aircraft's position is not known, the air traffic services unit shall:

a) attanpt to establish two-way communication with the aircraft, unless such communication

already exists;

b) use all available means to determine its position,

c) inform other ATS units into whose area the aircraft may have strayed or may stray, taking
into account all the factors which may have affected the navigation of the aircraft in the

circumstances;

d) inform, in accordance with locally agreed procedures, appropriate military units and provide

them with pertinent flight plan a-nd other data concerning strayed aircraft;

e) request from the units referred to in c) and d) and from o&er aircraft in flight every

assistance in establishing communication with the aircraft and determining its position.
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Note.- The requiremenls in d) and e) apply also to ATS units informed in accortkmce with c).

11.2.24.1.1.2 When the aircraft's position is established, the air traffic services unit shall:

a) advise the aircraft of its position and corrective action to be taken, and

b) provide, as necessary, other ATS units and appropriate military units with relevant
information concerning the strayed aircraft and any advice given to that aircraft.

11.2.24.1.2 As soon as an air traffic services unit becomes aware of an unidentified aircraft in
its area, it shall endeavor to establish the identity of the aircraft whenever this is necessary for
the provision of air fafffic services or required by the appropriate military authorities in
accordance with locally agreed procedures. To this end, the air traffic services unit shall take
such of the following steps as are appropriate in the circurnstances:

a) attempt to establish two-way communication with the aircraft;

b) inquire of other air traffic services units within the flight information region about the flight
and request their assistance in establishing two-way communication with the aircraft;

c) inquire of air traffic services units serving the adjacent flight information regions about the
flight and request their assistance in establishing two-way communication with the aircraft;

d) attempt to obtain information from other aircraft in the area.

11.2.24.1.2.1 The air traffic services rurit shall, as necessary, infonn the appropriate military
unit as soon as the identiry of the aircraft has been established.

11.2.24.1.3 Should the ATS unit consider that a strayed or unidentified aircraft may be the
subject of unlawful interference, the appropriate authority desigaated by CAAP shall
immediately be informed, in accordance with locally agreed procedures.

I I .2.24.2 Interception of civil aircraft

11.2.24.2.1 As soon as an air traffic seryices unit learns that an aircraft is being intercepted in
its area of responsi'oility, it shall take such of the foilowing steps as are appropriate in the
circumstances:

a) attempt to establish two-way comrntrnication wiflr the intercepted aircraft via any means

available, including the ernergency radio frequency 121.5 MFIz, rmless such communication
already exists;

b) inform the pilot of the intercepted aircraft of the interception;

c) establish contact with the intercept control unit maintaining two-way communication with
the intercepting aircraft and provide it with available information concerning the aircraft;

d) relay rnessages between the intercepting aircraft or the intercept control unit and the
intercepted aircraft, as necessary,

e) in close coordination with the intercept control unit take all necessary steps to ensure the
safety of the intercepted aircraft;

f) inforrn ATS units serving adjacent flight information regions if it appears that the aircraft has

strayed liom such adjacent flight rntbrmation regions.
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11.2.24.2.2 As soon as an air traffic services unit learns that an aircraft is being intercepted
outside its area of responsibility, it shall take such of the following steps as are appropriate in
the circumstances:

a) inforrn the ATS unit serving the airspace in which the interception is taking place, providing
this unit with available information that will assist in identiffing the aircraft and requesting it
to take action in accordance with T1.2.24.2.1;

b) relay messages betwee,n the interceptd aircraft and the appropriate ATS unit, the intercept
control mit or the intercepting aircmft.

11.2.25 Time in air trafric services

11.2.25.1 Air traffic services units shall use Coordinated Universal Time (UTC) and shall
express the time in hours and minutes and. when reqtrired. seconds of the 24- hour day
beginning at midnight.

11.2.25.2 Air traffic services units shall be equipped with clocks indicating the time in hours,
minutes and seconds, clearly visible from each operating position in the unit concerned.

11.2.25.3 Air traffic services unit clocks and other iime-recording devices shall be chwked as

necessary to ensure correct time to within plus or minus 30 seconds of UTC. Wherever data
link communications are utilized by an air fraffic services unit, clocks and othertime-recording
devices shall be checked as necessary to ensure correct tirne to within I second of UTC.

i1.2.25.4 fire con'ect time shall be obtained from a sl.andard time station or, if rrcl possible,
from another udt which has obtained the correct time from such station.

11.2.25.5 Aerodrome control towers shall, prior to an aircraft axiing for take-off, provide pilot
with the correct time, urless arrangements have been made for the pilot to obtain it &om other
sources. Air traffic services units shall, in addition provide aircraft with the correct time on
request. Time checks shall be given to the nearest half minute.

11.2.26 Establishment of requirements for carriage and operation of pressure- altitude
reporting transponders

11.2.26.1CAAP shall establish requirements for cariage and operation of pressure- altitude
reporting transponders within defined portions of airspace.

Note.- This pravision is interuled to improve the elfectiveness of air tralJic services as well as
ai rb o me col I i sion avoidance sys tems.

11.2.27 ATS safety management

Note. -- Annex 19 includes the salety management provisions applicable to ATS providers.
Further guidance is contained in the Safely Management Manual (SMM) (Doc 0959) and
assaciated pracedures are contained in the PANS-ATM {Doc 4444).

11.2.27.1 Any significant safety-related change to the ATS system, including the
implementation of a reduced separation minimum or a new procedure, shall only be effected
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after a safety assessment has demonstrated that an acceptable level of sfety will be met and

users have been consulted. When appropriate, the responsible authority shall ensure that
adequate prcvision is made for post-implementation monitoring to verift that the defineC level
of safety continues to be met.

Note. - When, due to the rutture of the change, the acceptable level of safety cannot be

expressed in quantitative tems, the safety assessment may rely on operational judgment.

11.2.27.2 The applicable levei of safety to be achieved shall be established by the CAAP.

Note. - Guidance on defining acceptable levels of safety is contained in the Safety Management
Manual (SMM) (Doc. 9859).

11.2.27.3 CAAP shall require, as part of their safety progrirm, that an air taffic services
provider implements a safety management system acceptable to the CAAP that, as a minimum;

a) identifies safety hazards;

b) ensures the Implementation of remedial action necessary to maintain agreed safety

performance;

c) provides for continuous monitoring and regular assessment of the safety performance; and

d) aims a continuous improvement of the overall performance of the safety management

system.

11.2.27.4 A safety management system shall clearly define lines of ffifety accountability
throughout the air traffic services provider including direct accountabililv for safety on the
part of senior management.

Note. -The framework for the implementation and maintenance of a safety manog9menl
system is contained in Appendix I I .6. Guidance on safety marutgement systems is contained in
the ATS Safety Management Systems Manual and associated procedures are contained in the

ATS Marual of Operatians.

11.2.28 Common reference systems

| 1.2.28.1 Horizontal reference system

World Geodetic System - 1984 (WGS-84) shall be used as a horizontal (geodetic) reference

system for air navigation. Reported aeronautical geographical coordinates (indicating latitude
and longitude) shall be expressed in tenns ofthe WGS-84 geodetic reference datum.

T2.2.28.2 Vertical reference system

Mean sea level (MSL) datum, which gives relationship of gravity-related height (elevation) to
a surface known as the geoid, shall be used as the vertical reference system for air navigation.

Note.-The Geoid globally most closely approximates MSL. It is de.fined as the equipotential
surlitce in the gravity Jield of the Earth which coincides with the undisturbed MSL extended

c ontinuously through the cantinents.

| 1 .2.28.3 Temporal reference system
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11.2.28.3.1The Gregorian calendar and Coordinated Universal Time (UTC) shall be used as

the temporal reference system for air navigation.

11.2.28.3.2 When a different temporal reference system is used, this shall be indicated in GEN
2.1.2 of Aeronautical Information Publication (AIP).

11.2.29 Language profi ciency

11.2.29.1 An air traffic services provicler shall ensnre that air ffaffic controllers speak and

understand the languag{s) used for radiotelephony communications as specified in CAR Part
2.

11.2.29.2 Except when communications between air raffic control units are conducted in a
mtrtually agreed language, the English language shall be used for such communications.

I 1.2.30 Contingency arrangements

Air traffic services authorities shall develop and promulgate contingency plans for
implementation in the event of disruption, or potential disnrption, of air traffic services and

related supporting services in the airspace for which they are responsible for the provision of
such services. Such contingency plans shall be developed with the assistance of ICAO as

necessary, in close coordination with the air traffic services authorities responsible for the
provision of services in adjacent portions of airspace and with airspace users concerned.

Note. - Guidance material relating ta the development, promulgation and implementation of
contingency plans is contained in Attachment E.

ll.2.3l Balanced approach to noise management

11.2.31.1 The balanced approach to noise management consists of identifying the noise

problern at an airport and then analyzing the various measures available to reduce noise

through the exploration of four principal elements, namely reduction at source (addressed in
PCAR 5.4.3 Certificate of Noise Compliance) land-use planning and management, noise

abatement operational procedures and operating restrictions, with the goal of addressing the

noise abatement operational procedures and operating restrictions, with the goal of addressing

the noise problem in the most cost-effective manner. All the elements of the Balanced

Approach are addressed in the Guidance on the Balanced Approach to Noise Management

(Doc.9829).

11.2.31.2 Aircraft operating procedures for noise abatement shall not be introduced until the
appropriate CAAP unit/s determines that a noise problem exists based on appropriate studies

and consultation.

11.2.31.3 Aircraft operating procedures for noise abatement should be developed in
consultation with the operators which use the aerodrome concerned.

ll .2.31 .4 The factors to be taken into consideration in the development of appropriate aircraft
operating procedures for noise abatement should include the following:
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a) the nature and extent of the noise problem including;

1. the location of noise sensitive areas; and
2. critical hours.

b) the types of aircraft affected, including aircraft mass, aerodrome elevation, temperature
considerations;

c) the types of procedwes likely to be most effective;

d) obstacle clearances (PANS-OPS (Doc 8168), Volumes I and II); and

e) human perfonnance in the application of the operating procedures.

ll.2.32ldentilication and delineation of prohibited, restricted and danger areas

11.2.32.1Each prohibited area, restricted area, or danger area established by a State shall, upon
initial establishment, be given an identification and full details shall be promulgated.

Note.--- See CAR-ANS Part 15, Appenda l5A, ENR 5.1.

11.2.32.2 The identification so assigned shall be used to identifi the area in all subsequent

notifications pertaining to that area.

11.2.32.3 The identification strall be composed of a group of letters and figures as follows:

a) nationality letters for location indicators assigned to the state or territory which has

established the airspace.

b) A letter P for prohibited area, R for restricted area and D for danger area as appropriate; and

c) A number, unduplicated within the State or territory concerned.

Note-- Nationality letters are those contained in Location Indicators (Doc V9l0).

11.2.32.4 To avoid confusion, identification numbers shall not be reused for a period of at least

one year after cancellation ofthe mea to which they refer.

11.2.32.5 When a prohibited, restricted or danger area is established, the area should be as

small as practicable and be contained within simple geomerical limits, so as to permit ease of
reference by all concemed.

11.3 AIR TRAPTIC CONTROL SERVICE

11.3.3 Operation of air traflic control service

11.3.3.3 Air traffic control units should be equipped with devices that record background

commtmication and aural environmert at air traffic controller work stations, capable of
retaining the information recorded during at least the last twenty-four hours of operation.

11.3.3.5.1 For all airspace where reduced vertical separation minimum of 300 m (1000ft) is
applied between FLZS} and FL 410 inclusive, a program shall be instituted, on a regional

basis, for monitoring the height-keeping performance of aircraft operating at these levels, in
ordcr to cnsurc that'ftc continucd application of this vcrtical scparation fiiinimrim mccts thc

safery objectives. The scope of regional monitoring progralnmes shall be adequate to conduct

analyses of aircraft group performance and evaluate the stability of altimetry system error.
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11.3.3.5.2 Arrangements shall be put in place through inter regional agreement, for the shming
between regions of data monitoring programs.

Note. - Guidance material relating lo vertical separation and monitoring of height- keeping
performance is contained in The mamtal on Implementation of a 300 m (1000 ft) Vertical
SeparationMinimum FL290 and 4l0Inclusive (ICAO Doc 9574).

I f 3.4 Separation minima

I1.3.4.1 The election of separation minima for application within a given portion of airspace

shall be as follows:

a) the separation minima shall be selected from those prescribed by the provisions of the ATS
Manual of Operations and the ICAO Regional Supplementary Procedures as applicable trnder

the prevailing circumstances except that, where tlpes of aids are used or circumstances prevail

which are not covered by current ICAO provisions, other separation minima shall be

established as necessary by:

1) the appropriate ATS authoriff, following consultation with operators, for routes or portions

of routes contained within the Philippine sovereign airspace;

2) regional air navigation agreernents for routes or portions of routes contained within airspace

over the high seas or over areas ofundetennined sovereignty.

Note. - Details of current separation minima prescribed by the Philippines are contained in the

ATS Manusl oJ'Operations and Part I of the Regionol Supplementary Procedures (Doc 7030).

1I.3.7.1.2 Standard departure and arrival routes and associated procedures should be

established when necessary to facilitate:

ll .3 .7 .2.2 The air traffic control clearance relating to the transonic deceleration and descent of
an aircraft from supersonic cruise to subsonic flight should provide for unintemrpted descent,

at least during the transonic phase.

11.3.7 .3 Read-back of clearances and safeqv-related information

1I.3.7.3.1 The flight crew shall read back to the air traffic controller safety-related parts of
ATC clearances and instructions which are transmitted by voice. The following items shall

always be read back:

a) ATC route clearances;

b) clearances and instructions to enter, land on, take offon, hold short of, cross and backtrack

on any runway; and

c) nrrway-in-use, altimeter settings, SSR codes, Ievel insfiuctions, heading and speed

instructions and, whether issued by the controller or contained in ATIS broadcasts, ffansition
levels.
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ll .3.7 .3.2 Unless specified by the appropriate ATS authority, voice read-back of CPDLC
messages shall not be required.

L 1.3.7 .4 Coordination of clearances

An air tffic confrol clearance shall be coordinated between air taffic confol units to cover
the entire route of an aircraft or a specified portion thereof as follows:

11.1.7,4,1 An aircraft shall be cleared for the entire route to the aercxlrome of first intended

landing:

a) when it has been possible, prior to departure, to coordinate the clearance between all the

units under whose contol the aircraft will come; or

b) when there is reasonable assurance that prior coordination will be effected between those

units under whose control the aircraft will subsequently come; or

Note.- l{here o clearance is issaed coveing the initial part of'the flight solely as a means of
expediting departing trafic, the succeeding en-route clearance will be as specified above even

though the aerodrome of .first intended landing is under lhe jurisdiction of an area control
cente.r olher than the one is,tuing lhe en-route clearo.nce.

11.3.7.4.2.L4 Where practicable, and where datalink comrnuSnications are used to facilitate
downstream clearance delivery, two-way voice communications between the pilot and the air
traffic control unit providing the downstream clearance should be available.

11.3.7.5.2 ATFM should be implernented on the basis of regional air navigation agreements or,
if appropriated, through multilateral agreements. Such agreements should make provision for
cofirmon procedures and common rnethods of capacity determination.

113.8 Control of persons and vehicles at aerodromes

11.3.8.1 The movement of persons or vehicles including towed aircraft on the maneuvering

area of an aerodrome shall be controlled by the aerodrome control tower as necessary to avoid

hazard to them or to aircraft landing, taxiing or taking off.
11.3.8.2 In conditions where low visibility procedures are in operafion:

a) persons and vehicles operating on tle maneuvering area of an aerodrorne shall be restricted
to the essential minimurn, and particular regard shall be given to the requirements to protect the

ILS sensitive area(s) when Category II or Category III precision instrument operations are in
progless;

b) subject to the provisions in 11.3.8.3, the rninirnurn separation between veiricles and taxiing
aircraft shall be as prescribed by the appropriate ATS authoriff taking into account the aids

available.

11.3.8.3 Emergency vehicles proceeding to the assistance of an aircraft in distress shall be

afforded priority over all other surhce movement traffic.

11.3.8.4 Subject to the provisions in 11.3.8.3, vehicles on the maneuvering area shall be

required to cornply with the following rules:
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a) vehicles and vehicles towing aircraft shall give way to aircraft which are landing, taking off
or taxiing;

b) vehicles shali give way to other vehicles towing aircraft;

c) vehicles shall give way to other vehicles in accordance with ATS unit instructions;

d) notrrithstanding the provisions of a), b) and c), vehicles and vehicles towing aircraft shall
comply with instructions issued by the aerodrome control tower.

11.3.9 Provision of radar and ADS-B

Radar and ADS-B ground systems should provide for the display of safety-related alerts and

warnings, including conflict alert, conflict prediction, minimum safe altitude waming and

unintentionally duplicated SSR codes.

11.3.10 Use of surface movement radar (SMR)

In the absence of visual observation of all or part of the maneuvering area or to supplement

visual observations, surface movement radar (SMR) provided in accordance with the
provisions of Annex 14, Volume I, or oflrer suitable surveillance equipment, sltould be utilized
to:

a) monitor the movements of aircraft and vehicles on the maneuverin g aroa;

b) provide directional information to pilots and vehicle drivers as necessary; and

c) provide advice and assistance for the safe and efficient movement of aircraft and vehicles on

the maneuvering area.

II.4 FLIGHT INFORMATION SERVICE

ll.4.l Application

11.4.2.3 ATS units should transmit, as soon as practicable, special air-reports to other aircraft
concerned, to the associated meteorological office, and to other ATS units concemed.

Transmissions to aircraft should be continued for a period to be determined by agreement

between the meteorological and air traffic services authorities concerned.

11.4.3 Operational flight information service broadcasts

11.4.3.2 Application

I I 4 3 I 1. Tlre rneteorologrca-l information and operational information conceming radio

navigation services and included in the flight information service shall, whenever available, be

provided in an operationally integrated fonn.

L1.4.3.1.2 Where integrated operational flight information messages are to be transmitted to

aircraft, they should be transmitted with the content and. where specified. in the sequence

indicated, for the various phases of flight.
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11.4.3.1.3 Operational flight information service broadcasts, u*ren provided, should consist of
messages containing integrated information regarding selected operational and meteorological
elernents appropriate to the various phases of flight. These broadcasts should be of three major
types, i.e. HF, VHF and ATIS.

1 I .4.3.2 HF operational flight information service (OFIS) broadcasts

11.4.3.2.1 HF operational flight information service (OFIS) broadcasts should be provided
when it has been determrned by regional air navigation agreements that a requirement exists.

11.4.3.2.2 Whenever such broadcasts are provided:

a) the information should be in accordance with 4.3.2.5, as applicable, subject to regional air
navigation agreemorts;

b) the aerodromes ftrr which repofts and forecasts are to be included should be as deteluriued
by regional air navigation agreements;

c) the time-sequencing of stations participating in the broadcast should be as determined by
regional air navigation agrcements;

d) the HF OFIS broadcast message should take into consideration human performance. The
broadcast message should not exceed the length of time allocated for it by regional air
navigation agreernents, care being taken that the readability is not impaired by the speed of the

transmission,

e) each aerodrome message should be identified by the name of the aerodrome to which the
information applies;

f) whan information has not been received in time for a broadcast, the latest available
information should be included together with the time of that observation;

g) the full broadcast should be repeated if this is feasible within the remainder of the time
allotted to the brcadcasting station;

h) the broadcast infomration should be updated immediately ifa sigrificant change occurs; and

i) the HF OFIS message should be prepared and disseminated by the most appropriate unit(s)
as designated by each State.

11.4.3.2.3 Pending the development and adoption of a more suitable fonn of speech for
universal use in aeronautical radiotelephony commurications, HF OFIS broadcasts concerning
aerodromes designated for use by intemational air services should be available in the English
language.

11.4.3-2.4 Where HF OFIS broadcasts are available in more than one language, a discrete

channel should be used for each language.

1I.4.3.2.5 HF operational flight information service broadcast messages should contain the

following information in the sequence indicated or as determined by regional air navigation

agreements:

a) En-route weather information

Information on significant en-route weather phenomena should be in the form of available

SIGMET as prescribed in Annex 3.
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11.4.3.3 VHF operational flight information service (OFIS) broadcasts

I 1.4.3.3.1 VHF operafional flight information service broadcasts should be provided as

determined by regional air navigation agreements.

1 I .4 .3 .3 .2 Whenever such broadcasts are pro vided :

a) the aerodromes for which reports and forecasts are to be included should be as detennined
by regional air navigation agreements;

b) each aerodrome message should be identified by the narne of the aerodrome to which the
information applies;

c) when information has not been received in time for a broadcast, the latest available
information should be included together with the time of that observation,

d) tlre broadcasts should be continuous and repetitive;

e) the YHF OFIS broadcast message should take into consideration human performance. The

broadcast message sirould, whenever practicabie, not exceexi five minutes, care being iaken that

the readability is not impaired by the speed of the transnission;

f) the broadcast message should be updated on a scheduled basis as determined by regional air
agreements. In addition it should be expeditiously updated imrnediately if a significant change

occurs, and

g) the VHF OFIS message should be prepared and disseminated by the most appropriate uri(s)
as designated by each State.

11.4.3.3.3 Pending the development and adoption of a more suitable fonn of speech for
universal use in aeronautjcal radiotelephony communications, VH OFIS broadcasts concerning

aerodromes designated for use by international air services should be available in the English

language.

11.4.3.3.4 Where VHF OFIS broadcasts are available in more than one language, a discrete

channel should be used for each language.

11.4.3.3.5 VHF operationat flight information service broadcast messages should contain the

following information in the sequence indicated:

a) name of aerodrome;

b) time of observation

c) landing nmway
d) siguificant nrnway surface conditions and, if appropriate, braking action;

e) changes in the operational state of flre radio navigation seryices, if appropriate;

fl holding delay, if appropriate;
g) surface wind direction and speel; if appropriate, maxiurum wind speed;
+h) visibility and, when a
ti) present weather;
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*j) cloud below 1500 m (5 000 ft) or below the highest minimum sector altitude, whichever is
greater; cumulonimbus; ifthe sky is obscured, vertical visibility, when available;
+*k) air temperahrre;
**l) dew point temperature;
* *m) QNH altimeter setting

n) supplementary information on recent weadrer of operational sigtificance and, where

necessary, wind shear;

o) trcnd forccast, *'hcn availablc; and

p) notice of current SIGMET messages
*These elements are replaced by the term *CAVOK" whenever the conditions as specified in
the PANS-ATM (Doc 44M), Chapter 1 I prevail.
* *As determined on the basis of regronal air navigation agreements.

11.4.3.4.7 Where Voice-ATIS broadcasts are available in more than one language, a discrete

channel should be used for each language.

I 1.4.3.4.8 The Voice-ATIS broadcasts message should, whenever practicable, not exceed 30

seconds, care heing taken that the readability of the ATIS message is not impaired hy the speed

ofthe transmission or by the identification signal ofa navigation aid used for transmission of
ATIS. The ATIS broadcast message should take into consideration human performance.

11.4.3.5 Data link-automatic terminal information service (D-ATIS)

11.4.3.5.1.1 Where real-hme meteorological tnlbrmatton is included but the data remains

within the parameters of the sigrificant change criteria, the content, for the purpose of
maintaining the same designator, shall be considered identical.

Nole.- Significanl change criteria ore specrfed in Armex 3, 4.3.4

11.4.3.5.2 Where a D-ATIS supplements the existing availabiliry of Voice-ATIS and the ATIS
requires updating, Voice-ATIS and D-ATIS shall be updated simultaneously.

Nole. - Guidance mdteridl relating lo D-AT'IS is conlained in the Mafiual of Air Trafic
Services Data Link Applications (Doc 9691). The technical requirements .fot the D-ATIS

application are contained in.4nne,c 10, ltolume III, Part l, Chapter 3.

11.4.3.6.5 Contents of ATIS should be kept as brief as possible. Information additional to that

specified in 11.4.3.7 to 11.4.3.9, for example information already available in aeronautical

information publications (AIPs) and NOTAM, should only be included when justified in
exceptional circumstances.

I 1.4.3.7 ATIS for aniving and departing aircraft

ATIS messages containing both arrival and departure information shall contain the following
elements of information in the order listed:



*These elements are replaced by the term "CAVOK" whenever the conditions as specified in
the PAN-ATM (Doc 4M4, Chapter 1l prevail.

tAs determined on the basis of regional air navigation agreements.

11.4.3.8 ATIS for arriving aircraft

ATIS messages containing arrival information only shall contain the following elements of
information in the order listed:

*These elements are replaced by the term "CAVOK" whenever the conditions as specified in
the PAN-ATM (Doc 4444,Chapter l1 prevail.

f As determined on the basis ofregional air navigational agrements.

11.4.3.9 ATIS for departing aircraft

ATIS messages containing departure information only shall contain the following elements of
information in the order listed:

*These elements are replaced by the term "CAVOK', whenever the conditions as specified in
the PANS-ATM (Doc. 4444), Chapter I lprevail.

tAs determined on the basis of regional air navigation

11.4.4 VOLMET broadcasts and D-VOLMET service

I1.4.1.1 HF and/or VHF VOLMET broadcasts and lor D-VOLMET service should be provided
when it has been determined by regional air navigation agreements that a requirement exists.

L1.4.4.2 YOLMET broadcasts should use standard radiotelephony phraseologies.

11.5 ALERTING SERYICE

11.5.1.2 Flight Flight information centers or area control centers shall serve as the central point
for collecting all information relevant to a state of emergency of an aircraft operating within
fhe flight information region or eonfrol area concerneel aud ftrr forwareling such information to
the appropriate rescue coordination center.

11.5.2.2.1 Such part of the information specified in 11.5.2.2, which is not available at the time
notification is made to a rescue coordination center, should be sought by an air traffic services
unit prior to tire der;laration of a distress phase, if there is reasonable certainry-that tliis phase

will eventuate.

11.6 ArR TRAFFIC SERVICES REQUIREMENTS FOR COMMLTNICATIONS

I 1.6.1 Aeronautical mobile service (air-ground communications)

11.6.1.1 General
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11.6.1.1.1 Radiotelephony and/or data link shall be used in air-ground communications for air
traffi c service purposes.

1T.6.1.1.2 When RCP types have been prescribed by States for ATM firnctions, ATS units
shall, in addition to the requirements specified in I I .6.1 .1 .l , be provided with cornmunications
equipment which will enable them to provide ATS in accordance with the prescribed RCP
types(s).

11.6.1.1.3 When direct pilot-controller two-way radiotelephony or data link communications
are used for the provision of air traffic control service, recording facilities shall be provided on
all such air-ground communication channels.

11.6.1.2.2 Whenever practicable, air-groturd communication facilities for flight information
service should pernrit direct, rapid, continuous and static-free two-way communications.

11.6.1.3.3 Where air-ground voice communication channels are used for mea control service
and are worked by air-ground commmicators, suitable arrangements should be rnade to permit
direct pilot-controller voice communications, as and when required.

11"6.1.5.2 Where conditions warrant, separate communication channels should be provided for
the control of traffic operating on the maneuvering area.

11.6.2 Aeronautical fixed service (ground-ground communications)

11.6.2.i Generai

11.6.2.1.1 Direct-speech communications shall be used in ground-grourd communications for
air traffic services purposes.

Note.- Indication by time ofthe -rpeed with which the communication should he established is
provided cs cr guide to communiccttion sentices, ptrtiailarly to determine the types of
communication channels required, e.g. that "inslanteneous" l"r intended to refer to
communicatians which ffictively pravide for immediate access between controllers: "fifteen
seconds" to accept swilchhoard operation and "Jive minules" ta mean methods involving
retransmission.

11.6.2.1.2 Where RCP types have been prescribed by States for ATM functions, ATS units
shall, in addition to the requirements specified in I I .6.2. I . I , be provided with communications
equipment which will enable them to provide ATS in accordance with the prescribed RCP
types(s).

1I.6.2.2 Communications within a flight information regron

11.6.2.2.2 Communications berween air traffic services units and other units.

1L.6.2.2.3.2 In all cases not covered by 11.6.2.2.3.1, the cornmunication facilities should
include provisions for:
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1T.6.2.2.3.3 In all cases where automatic transfer of data to and/or from air traffic services
computers is required, suitable facilities for automatic recording should be provided.

11.6.2.2.3.4 The commrxrication faciiities required in accordance with ii.6.2.Z.1 and
11.6.2.2.2 should be supplemented. as and where necessary, by facilities for other forms of
visual or audio communications, for example, closed circuit television or separate information
processing systems.

71.6.2.2.3.6 The communications facilities required under 11.6.2.2.2.2 d) should include
provisions for commurications by direct speech ananged for conference commurications,
whereby the communications can normally be established within fifteen seconds.

11.6.2.2.3.7 All facilities for direct-speech or data link communications between air traffic
services units and between air raffic services units and appropriate military units shall be
provided with automatic recording.

11.6.2.3 Communications between flight information regions

11.6.2.3.1.4 The cornmunicatiou facilities in 11.5.2.3.1 should permit corrynunications to be
established normally within fifteen seconds.

11.6.2.3.2 Adjacent ATS units shall should be connected in all cases where special
circumstances exist.

11.6.2.3.3 -Wherever iocai conditions are such that it is necessary to ciear akcrafr. into an
adjacent conffol area prior to departrue, an approach control unit and/ or aerodrorne control
tower should be connected with the area control center serving the adjacent area.

11.6.2.3.4 The communication facilities in 11.6.2.3.2 and 11.6.2.3.3 should include provisions
for commudcations by direct speech alone, or in combination with data link communications,
with automatic recording, whereby for the purpose of transfer of control using rzdar or ADS-B
or ADC-data, the communications can he established instantaneously and for other purposes
the communications can nonnally be established within fifteen seconds.

1 1 .6.2.4 Procedures for direct-speech communications

Appropriate procedures for direct-speech communications should be developed to pennit
immediate connections to be made for every urgent calls conceming the safeff of aircraft, and
the intemrption, if necessary, of less urgent calls in progress at the time.

11.63 Surface movement control service

I 1.6.3.1.2 Where conditions warrant, separate comrnunication channels should be provided for
the control of vehicles on the maneuvering arca. Automatic recording facilities should be
provided on all such channels.

11.6.3.1.3 Recordings of data and communications as required tnll.6.?.2.3.3 and 11.6.2.2.3.7
shall be retained for a period of at least tldrry days.

11.6.4 Aeronantical radio navigation service
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11.6.4.1.1 Surveillance data from primary and secondary radar equipment or other systems
(e.g- ADS-B, ADS-C), used as an aid to air traffic services, should be automatically recorded
for use in accident and incident investigations, search and rescue, air traffic contol and
surveillance systems evaluation and training.

11.6.4.1.2 Automatic recordings should be retained for a period of at least fourteeu days. When
the recordings are pertinent to accident and incident investigations, they should be retained for
ionger periods until it is evident that they will no longer be required.

I1.7 AIR TRAFFIC SERVICES REQUIREMENTS FOR INFORMATION

11.7.1.1.1 Air traffic services units shall be supplied with up-to-date information on existing
and forecast meteorological conditions iN necessary for the performance of flreir respective
functions. The information shall be supplied in such a form as to require a minimum of
interpretation on the part of air traffic services persorurel and with a frequency which satisfies
the requirements of the air traffic services units concerned.

11.7.1.L.2 Meteorological o{fices should be so situated as to facilitate personal consultation
between meteorological personnel mrd personnel of units providing air traf;fic services. Where
collocation is not practicable, the required consultation should be achieved by other means.

1 I .7. I .1 .3 Air traffic services units should be supplied with available detailed information on
the location, vertical extent, direction and rate of movement of meteorological phenomena in
the vicimty of the aerodrome, and particularly in the climb-out and approach areas, wfuch
could be hazardous to aircraft operations.

11.7.1.1.4 When computer-processed upper air data are made available to air traffic services
units in digital form for use by air traffic services computers, the contents, format and
transmission alrangements should be as agreed between the Metmrological Authoriy and the
appropriate ATS Authority.

11.7 .1.L.5 Pilot's responsibili6r in compliance with the Rules of the Air: Pre-flight action.

11.7.1.3 Units providing approach control service

1L.7.1.3.1 Units providing approach control service shall be supplied with meteorological
information as described in Annex 3, Annex 9,1.2 for &e airspace and the aerodromes with
which they are concerned. Spe-cial reports and amendments to forecasts shall be communicated
to the units providing approach conffol service as soon as they are necessary in accordance
with established criteria, without waiting for the next routine report or forecast. Where multiple
anemometcrs are used, the indicators to which they are related shall be clearly marked to
identify the runway and section of the runway monitored by each anemometer.

11.?.1.3.3 Units providing approach control service for final approach, landing and take-off
shall be equipped with strface wind indicator(s). The indicato(s) shall be related to the same
location(s) of observation and be fed from the same auanometer(s) as the corresponding
indicator(s) in the aerodrome control tower and in the metmrological station, where such a
station exists.
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ll.7 .1.3.4 Units providing approach control seryice for final approach, landing and take-off at
aerodromes where runway visual range values are assessed by instnrmental means shall be
equipped with indicator(s) permitting read-out of the current nulway visual range value(s). The
indicator(s) shall be related to the same location(s) of observation and be f"d to* the same
nrnway visual range measuring device(s) as the corresponding indicator(s) in the aerodrome
control tower and in the metmrological station, where such a station exists.

11.7.1.3.5 Units providing approach control service for finai approach, landing and take-offat
aerodromes where the height of cloud base is assessed by instrumental means should be
equipped with display(s) permitting read-out of the current value(s) of the height of the cloud
base. The displays should be related to th4e same location(s) of observations anA rc fed from
the same sensor(s) as the corresponding display(s) in the aerodrome control tower and in the
meteorological station, where such a station exists.

IL7.1.3.6 Units providing approach control service for final approach, landing and take-off
should be supplied with information on wind shear which could adversely affect aircraft on the
approach or take-offpaths or during circling approach.

Note.' Pravisions concerning the issuance of wind tihear warnings ond AIS requirements for
meteorological infbtmatioft are given in Annex 3, Chapters 7 and 10, respectively.

11.7.1.4.5 Aerodrome conffol towers at aerodromes where the height of cloud base is assessed
by instrumental means should be equipped with display(s) permitting read-out of the current
value(s) of the height of cloud base. The displays should be related to the same location(s) of
observation and be fed from the sarne sensor(s) as the corresponding display(s) in the
meteorological station, where such a station exists.

11.7.1.4.6 Aerodrome control towers should be supplied with information on wind shear which
could adversely affect aircraft on the approach or take-off paths or during circling approach
and aircraft on the runway during landing roll or take-offrun.

11.7.1.4.7 Aerodrome control towers and/or other appropriate units should be supplied with
aerodrome warnings.

Note.- The meteorological canditions.for which aerodrome warnings are ismed are listed I
CAR-ANS Part 3, Appendix 3.6, 5.].2.

ll.T.S lnformation on the operational status of navigation services

1T.7.32 Infonnation on the operational status, and any changes thereto, of radio navigation
services and visual aids as referred to in 11.7.3.1should be received by the appropriate ATS
unit(s) on a timely basis consistent with the use of the service(s) and aid(s).

APPENDIX 11.1 PRINCIPLES GOVERNING THE IDENTIFICATION OF
NAYIGATION SPECIFICATIONS AND THE IDENTIFICATION OF ATS ROUTES
OTHER TITAN STAI\DARD DEPARTURE AND ARRIVAL ROUTES

keeCAR-AN,ql/ 2 Sections !l.2.7and ll? llt
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11.2 Composition of designator

11.2.1.2 T1l,e number of characters required to compose the designator should, whenever
possible, be kept to a maximum of five characters.

'Ll.7 
.l.4Aerodrome control towers

11.4.4 Where the letters "F" or "G" specified in 11.2.4 above are used, the flight crew should
not be required to use them in voice communications.

APPENDD( 1I.2. PRINCIPLES GOVERNING THE ESTABLISHMENT AND
IDENTIFICATION OF SIGNIFICANT POINTS

11.1 Establishment of significant points

11.1.1 Significant points should, whenever possible, be established with reference to ground-
based radio navigation aids, preferably VHF or higher frequency aids.

11.2 Deignators for significant points marked by the site of a radio navigation aid

ll.2.l.2In selecting a name for the significant point, care shall be named with reference to an
identifiable and preferably prominent geographical location.

c) the name should, if possible, consist of at least six letters and form two syllables and
preferably not more than three;

11.5 Significant points used for reportiag purposes

11.s.4

b) the availability of a radio navigation aid at a location should not necessarily determine its
designation as compulsory reporting point;

c) compulsory reporting points should not necessarily be established at flight information
region or control area boundaries.

11.5.7 Routine reporting oyer compulsory reporting points should not systematically be made
mandatory for all flights in all circumstances. In applying this principle, particular attention
shaii be given to the foiiowing:

a) high-speed, high flyrng aircraft should not be required to make routine position reports over
all reporting points established as compulsory for low-speed, low flying aircraft;

b) aircraft tmnsiting through a terrninal control area should not k required to make routine
position reports as frequent$ as arriving and departing aircraft.
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APPENDIX 113. PRINCIPLES GOVERNING
STANDARD DEPARTI.JRE AND ARRIVAL
PROCEDLIRES

THE IDENTIF'ICATION OF
ROUTES AND ASSOCIATED

11.1 Designators for standard departure and arrival routes and associated procedures

Note.- In the follawing text the term "route" is used in the meaning of "route and associated
procedures"

I 1.1.1 The system f designators shall:

11.3. Assignment of designators

7I3 2 To distinguish betw-een txo or more routes w-hich relate to the same significant point
(and therefore are assigned the same basic indicator), a separate route indicator is describid in
2. I .4 shall be assigned to each route.

11.5 Examples of plain language and coded designators

11.5.1.1 Meaning: The designator identifies a standard instrument departure route which
terminates at the significant point BRECON (basic indicator). BRECON is a radio navigation
facility with the identification BCN (basic indicator of the coded designator). fhe vatidiq,
indicator ONE (1 in the coded designator) signifies either that the original version of the route
is still in eftct or that a change has been made &om the previous yersion NINE (9) to the now
effective version ONE (l ) (see 4.3). The absence of a route indicator (see 11.2.1. 4 and, 11.3.2)
signifies that only one route, in this case a depafire route, has been established with reference
tO BRECON.

l!.6.4.2 Meaning'. The designator identifies an MLSIRNAV approach procedure rvhich begins
at the significant point HAPPY (basic indicator). HAPPY is a significant point not marked by
the site of a radio navigation facility and therefore assigned a five-letter name-code in
accordance with Appendix 2. The validity indicator ONE (1) signifies that either the original
version of the route is still in effect or a change has been made from the previous version NINE
(9) to the now effective version ONE (l). The route indicator ALPHA (A) identifies one of
several routes established with reference to HAPPY and is a specific character assigned to this
route.

ATTACHMENT 11A. MATERIAL RELATING TO A METHOD OF ESTABLISHING
ATS ROUTES DEFINED BY VOR

(Chapter 11.2.7.1 andSection ll.2.ll refer)

I 1.2 Determination of VOR system performance values

The large variability of the vaiues which me likely to be associated with each of the factors that
make up flre total VOR system, and the limitation of presenfly available methods to measure all
these effects individually with the required precisioq have led to the conclusion that an
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assessment of the total system error provides a more realistic method for determining the VOR
system perfonnance. The material contained in 3 and 4 should be applied only after study of
Circular 120 especially with respect to the environmental cnnditions-

Note.- Gutdance material on overall VOR system accuracy is also cantained in Annex 10,
Volume I, Attachment C. (CAR-ANS Part 6, Attachrnent B).

11.3.1 For V0R-defined routes where radar is not usd to assist aircraft in remaining within the
protected airspace, the following guidance is provided. However, when the lateral deviations of
aircraft are being controlled with the aid of radar monitoring, the size of the protected airspace
required may be rduced, as indicated by practical experience gained in the airspace under
consideration.

11.4. Spacing of parallei routes defined by VORs

11.4.2 This spacing of parallel routes assumes:

d) no real-time radar monitoring or control of the lateral deviations is exercised.

71.4.4 Application of radar monitoring and control of the lateral deviations of the aircraft rnay
have a large effect on the minimum allowable distance between routes. Studies on the effect of
radar monitoring indicate that:

According to these studies and taking into account the experience some States have
accumulated over many years with parallel route systems under continuous radar control, it can
be expected that a reduction to the order of 15 to 18.5 lan (8 to l0 NM), but most probably not
less than 13 km (7 NM), may be possible as long as radm monitoring workload is not increased
substantially by that reduction. Actual operations of such systems using reduced lateral spacing
have shown that:

- it is very important to define and publish change-over points (see also 6);
-- large tums should be avoided when possible; and

- where large turns cannot be avoided, required turn profiles should be defined for turns
larger than 20 degrees.

Even where the probabiliy of total radar failure is very small, procedures to cover that case

should be considered.

11.6 Change-oYer points for VORs

11.6.2 Nothing in 11.6.1 should be interpreted as placing a restriction on the service ranges of
VOR installations rneeting the specifications in Annex 10, Volume I, 3.3. (CAR-ANS Part 6,

6.3.3).

.* END
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AMENDED REGULATION:

CAR-ANS Part tt
(Amcndment S0A)

ll.l Delinitions

Air traffic eontrollcr schdu!", A plan for.allocating air faffic controller duty periods and non-duty periods over a period oftime" otherwise referrJd t" u, u.o.t.r.

Alternote aerodrome. An aerodrome to which an aircraft may proceed when it becomes eitherimpossible or inadvisable tc proceed to or to land at the aerodrome of intended landing wherethe necessary services and facilities are available, where aircraft performance requirements can
be met and which is operational at the expected time of use. Alternate aerodromes include thefollowing:

Toke'aff alternote- An altemate aerodrome at which an aircraft would be able to land shouldthis become necessary shortly after take-off and it is not possible to use the aerodrome of
deparhre.

En'route altetnate- An alternate aerodrome at which an aircraft would be able to land in the
event that a diversion becomes necessary while en route.

Desfin*tion alternate- An alternate aerodrome at which an aircraft would be able to land
should it become either impossible or inadvisable to land at the aerodrome of intended landing.
Note' -- The aerodrome from which aflight departs may al.so be an en-route or a destination
olternste aerodrome .for that.flight.

Apptopriate ATS authority. The relevant authoriry designated by the State responsible forproviding air faffic services in the airspace concerned.

Controlted airspaee An airspace of defined dimensions wiflrin which air traffic control service
is provided in accordance with the airspace classification.

Note. - Controlled airspace is a generic tenn which covers ATS airspace Classe,s A, B, C, I)
and E as described in I 1.2.d.

Dato- quality- A degree or level of confidence that the data provided meets the requirements of
the data user in terms of accuracy, resolution and integrity.

Datum- Any quantity or set of quantities that may serve as a reference or basis for the
calculation of other quanrities (ISO 19104*).

DuU. Any task that an air traffic controller is required by the air traffic services provider to
perform. These tasks include those performed during time-in-position, administrative work and
training.
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Duty perind. A period which starts when an air traffic controller is required by an air trafficservices provider to report for or to commence a duty and ends when that person is free fromall duties.

Fatigue' A physiological state of reduced q."t4 or physical perfonnance capability resultingfrom sleep loss, extended wakefulness, circaoian bms",.-*ouo. workload (mental and/orphysical activiff) that can impair u p.rior', alertness and ability to perform safety-relatedoperational duties.

Fatigue risk managemcnt systcm (FRMS). A data-driven means of continuously monitoringand managing fatigue-related safety riskq based ,rpo, ,"i*tific principles, knowledge andoperational experience that aims to ensure relevant personnel are performins ut adequate levelsof alertness.

rncfulenl An occurrence, other than an accident, associated with the operation of an aircraftwhich affects or could affect the safeff of operation.

Note' - The types of incidents which are oJ'main inrerest to the International Civil Aviation
Organizationfor accident preventian studies are listed in Annex t J, Attachment C,

Instrument "tl4ht prucedare design servtce. A service established for the design,
documentation, validation, maintenance and periodic review of instrument flight procedures
necessary for the safety, regularity and efficiency of air navigation.

Non4uty periad. A continuous and defined period of time, subsequent ro andlor prior ro dury
periods, during which the air traffic controller is free of all duties.

Obstacle. AII fixed (whether ternporary or permanent) and mobile objects, or parts thereo{
that:

a) are located on an area intended for the surface movement of aircraft; or
b) extend above a defined surface intended to protect aircraft in flight; or
c) stand outside those defined surfaces and that have been assessed as being a hazard to air

navigation.

Operator. A person, organization or enterprise engaged in or offering to engage in an aircraft
operation.

Performance&ased commanieatian (PBC). Communication based on performance
specifications applied to the provision of air traffic services.

Note. - An RCP speci/ication indudes communicalion performance requirements that are
allocated to system companents in tenns of the communication ta be provided and associated
transaclion time, continuity, availability, integrity, saJbty and .functionality needed for the
proposed operation in the cantext of a particular airspace concept.

Performance-based navigation eBf$. Area navigation based on performance requirements
for aircraft operating along an ATS route, on an instrument approach procedure or in a
designatd airspace.
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Note'- Performance requirements are expressed in navigation specificotions (RNAVspecificatian, WP specification) in terms oi o*1o"y, integrity, continuity, availability andfunctionality neededfor the propased operation in the contexi af a particular airspace concept.

Performance-based.surveillance (PBS) surveillance based on performance specificationsapplied to the provision of air traffic services.

Note'- An RSP speciJication inclucles 
-surveillance perfotmance requirements rhar areallgcated to system components in terms of the surveitlaiceii be pravided and associated datadelivery time, continu^ity, availability, integrity, acc-uracy oJ'the surveillance data, saJbry and

-functionality neededfor the proposid operation in the cintixt oJ"a particular airspace concept.

Radtotelcphany' A form of radio communication primarily intended for the exchange ofinfonnation in the form of speech.

Reporting point A specified geographical Iocation in relation to which the position of anaircraft can be reported.

Required eommunication performnnce (RCP) specificaion A set of requirements for airfrafflc service provision and as,sociated ground e[uipinent, aircraft capability, and operations
needed to support performance-based communication

Required sumeillance performance (RSP) specifuation A set of requirements for air trafficservice provision and associated ground equipmJnt, aircraft capabilit5l and operations neededto support performance-based surveillance.

SIGMET informotian Infonnation issued.ty-a maeorological watch office concerning theorcIurence or expected occulrenc€ of specified en-route weither and other phenomena in the
atrnosphere that may affect the safety of aircraft operations.

Special VrRflbht- A VFR flight cleared by air traffic control to operate within a conffol zone
in meteorological conditions below VMC.

Time-tn-posttion The period of time when an air traffic controller is exercising the privileges
of the air fraffic controller's licence at an operational position.

11.2 GENERAL

11.2.6.2 Within the Manila FI& the airspace is divided into the following classes: A, B, D and
G, the details of which are published in the philippine AIp, ENR 1.4.

11.2.7 Performance-based navigation (pBN) operations

ll.2-7.2 Performance-based navigation operations shall be irnplemented as soon as practicable.
L1.2-7.3 The prescribed navigation specification shall be appropriate to the level of
communications, navigation and air traffic services provided in the airspace concerned.

11.2.8 Performance-based communication (pBC) operations
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11.2.8.1 In applying performance-based communication (PBC), RCP specifications shall be
prescribed by CAAP. When applicable, the RCP specification(s) shall be prescribed on the
basis of regional air navigation agreements.

Not*- In prescribing an RCP specification, limitations may apply as a result of
communicalion infrastracture conslraints or specific communication functionality
requirements.

11.2.8.2 The prescribed RCP specification shall be appropriate to the air traffic services
provided.

Note.- {nformation on the performance-based communication and surveillance (PBCS)
concept and gtidance material on it.s implementation are contained in the Performance-based
Comrnunication and Surveillance (PBCS) Manual (Doc 9869).

11.2.9 Perfomrance.based surveillance (PBS) operations

1T.2.9.1 In applying perfonnance-based strveillance (PBS), RSP specifications shall be
prescribed by CAAP. When applicable, the RSP specification(s) shall be prescribed on the
basis of regional air navigation agreements.

Note.- In prescribtng an RSP speci/ication, limitations may apply as a result of ,surveillance
infrastructure constraints ar specific sarveillance.fitnctionality requirements.

11.2.9.2 The prescribed RSP specification shall be appropriate to the air traffic services
provided.

17.2.9.3 Where an RSP specification has been prescribed by CAAP for performance-based
surveillance, ATS rmits shall be provided with equipment capable of performance consistent
with flre prescribed RSP specification(s).

Nole.- Inlormation on the PB{:S concept and guidance material on its implementation are
contained in the Performance-based Communication and Surveillance (PBCS) Manual @oc
e86e).

11.2.10 Establishment and designation of the units providing air traffic services

The air traffic seryices shall be provided by units established and designated as follows:

11.2.10.1 Flight information centers shall be established to provide flight information service
and alerting service within flight information regions, and shall be published in the
Aeronautical lnformation Publication (AIP).

Note.- This does not preclule delegating to other units the function af providing certain
e lements of' the fiight informalion sewice.

n.2.n.2 Air traffic conffol units shall be established to provide air traffic control seryice,

flight information service and alerting service within control areas, control zonss and at

controlled aerodromes, and shall be published in the AIP.
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Note. - The service,s to be provided by vafious air traffic control units ore indicated in I 1.3.2

11.2.11Specifications for flight information regions, control areas and control zones.

T1.2.11.1 The delineation of airspace, wherein air traffic services are to be provided, shall be
related to the nature of the route structure and the need for efficient seryice rather than to
national boundaries.

Note l.- Agreements to permit the delineation of airspace tying across national boundaries are
adttisable when such actionwillfacilitate the provision of air tralfic services (see tl.2.l.l).
Agreements which permit delineation of airspace boundories by straigltt lines will, for
example, be most convenient where data processing techniques are used by air traffic services
units.

Note 2.- Where delineation of airspace is made by reference to national boundaries there is a
need.fbr saitably .sited transfer points lo be mutually agyeedupan.

11.2.11 .2 Flight Information Regron

11.2.11.2.1 Flight Information Regions shall be delineated to cover the whole of the air route
structure to be served by such regions.

I1.2.11.2.2 Aflight information region shall include all airspace within its lateral limits, except
as limited by an upper flight information region.

11.2.11.2.3 Where a flight information region is limited by an upper flight information region,
the lower limit specified for the upper flight information region shall constitute the upper
vertical limit of the flight infonnation region and shall coincide with a VFR cruising level of
the tables in PCAR Part 8, 8.8.3.4.

Note.-- In cases where an upper flight information region is established the procedares
applicable therein need rutt be identicat with those applicable in the underlying .flight
information region.

I1.2.11.3 Control Areas

11.2.11.3,1 Control areas including, inter alia, airways and terminal control areas shall be
delineated so as to encompass sufficient airspace to contain the flight paths of those IFR flights
or portions thereof to which it is desired to provide the applicable parts of the air naffic control
service, taking into account the capabilities of the navigation aids normally used in that area.

Note.- In a control area other than one.formed by a system of airwrrys, a system of routes may
be estahlished to.fitctlitate the provision of air trffic control.

11.2.11.3.2 A lower limit of a control area shall be established at a height above the ground or
water ofnot less than 200 m (700 ft).

l1.2.ll-3.2.1The lower limit of a control area shall, when practicable and desirable in order to
allow freedom of action for VFR flights below the control area, be established at a greater

height than the minimum specified lrlll.2.ll.3.2.
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11.2.11.3.2.2 When the lower limit of a control area is above 900 m (3 000 ft) MSL it shall
coincide with a VFR cruising level of the tables in PCAR Part 8, IS:8.8.3.4.

11.2.11.3.3 An Llpper limit of a control area shall be established when either:
a) air traffic confol service will not be provided above such upper limit; or
b) the control area is situated below an upper control area, in which case the upper limit shall
coincide with the lower limit of the upper control area.

c) When established, such upper limit shall coincide wiflr the table of YFR cnrising levels in
CARPart 8.

1I.2.11.4 Flight information regions or control areas in the upper airspace

11.2.11.4.1 Where it is desirable to limit the ntrmber of flight information regions or conffol
areas through which high flying aircraft would otherwise have to operate, a flight information
reglon or control area, as appropriate, shall be delineated to include the upper airspace within
the lateral limits of a number of lower flight information regions or confrol areas.

11.2.11.5 Control zones

11.2.11.5.1 The lateral limits of control zones shall encompass at least those portions of the
airspace, which are not within control areas, containing the paths of IFR flights arriving at and
departing from aerodromes to be usd under instrument meteorological conditions.

Note.-Aircrutft halding in the vicinity of aerodromes are considered as arriving aircraft.

11.2.11.5.2 The lateral limits of a control zone shall extend to at least 9.3 km (5 NM) from the
centre of the aerodrome or aerodromes concerned in the directions frorn which approaches may
be made.

Note.-A control zone may include two or more aerodromes situated close together.

11.2.11.5.3 If a control zone is located within the lateral limits of a control area, it shall extend
upwards from the surface of the earth to at least the lower limit of the control area.

Note- An upper limit higher tkm the lower limit of the overlying contrcl area may be
e stahlished when desired.

11.2.11.5.4 If a control zone is located outside of the lateral limits of a control area, an upper
limit shall be established.

11.2.11,5.5 If it is desired to establish the upper limit of a control zone at a level higher than
the lower limit of the conffol area established above iq or if the control zone is located outside
of the lateral limits of a confrol area, its upper limit strall be established at a level which can
easily be identified by pilots. When this limit is above 900 rn (3 000 ft) MSL it shall coincide
with the VFR cruising level of the tables as published in the Philippine AIP.

Note.-- fhis implies that, if used, the selected YtrR cruising level be sach that expected local
atmospheric pressure varialions do not re.salt in a lowering of this limit to a height of'less than
200 m (700 fA rsbove ground or water.

37



ll.2.l2ldentilication of air traffic service uni8 and airspaces

11.2.12.1An area control centre or flight information centre shall be identified by the name of
a nearby town or crty or geographic feature.

1T.2.12.2 An aerodrome control tower or approach conffol unit shall be identified by the name
of the aerodrome at which it is located.

11.2.1?.3 A control zone, control area or flight information region shall be identified by the
name of the turit having jurisdiction over such airspace.

ll.2.l3 Establishment and identi{ication of ATS routes

11.2.13.1 When ATS routes are established, a protected airspace along each ATS route and a
safe spacing between adjacent ATS routes shall be provided.

11.2.13.2 When warranted by densrty, complexity or nature of the traffic, special routes shall
be established for use by low-level traffic, including helicopters operating to and from
helidecks on the high seas. When determining the laterd spacing between such routes, account
shall be taken of the navigational means available and the navigation equipment carried on
board helicopters.

11.2.13.3 ATS routes shall be identified by designators.

11.2.13.4 Designators for ATS routes other than standard departure and arrival routes shall be
selected in accordance with the principles set fodh in Appendix 11.1.

11.2.73.5 Standard deparnre and arrival routes and associated procedures shall be identified in
accordance with the principles set forth in Appendix 1l.3.

Note l.- Guidance material relating lo the establishment oJ-A7S roules is contained in lhe Air
Trffic Seruices Planning Matrusl (Doc 9426).

Note 2.- Guidance malerial relating la the establishment ol'ATS routes deJined hy VOR is
contained in Anachment A.

Note 3.- The spacing between parallel tracks or belween parallel ATS route center lines based
on performance-based navigatirsn will be dependent upon the relevant navigation specification
required.

ll.2.l4 Establishment of change-over points

ll.2.l4.l Change-over points shall be established on ATS route segments defined by reference
to very high frequency omnidirectional radio ranges where this will assist accurate navigation
along the route segments. The establishment of change- over points shall be limited to route
segments of 110 km (60 NM) or more, except where the complexiSz of ATS routes, the density
of navigation aids or other teclrnical and operational reasons waffant the establishment of
change-over points on shorter route segments.

LL.2.14.2 Unless otherwise established in relation to the performance of the navigation aids or
frequenry protection criteria, the change-over point on a route segment shall be the mid-point
between the facilities in the case of a straight route segment or the intersection of radials in the

case of a route segment which changes direction between the facilities.
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Note.- Guidance on the establisltment of change-over points is contained in Attachment I lA.

11.2.15 Establishment and identification of significant points

lI.2.T5.l Significant points shall be established for the purpose of defining an ATS route or
instrument approach procedure and/or in relation to the requirements of air traffic services for
information regmding the progress of aircraft in flight.

11.2.15.2 Significant points shall be identified by designators.

11.2.15.3 Significant points shall be established and identified in accordance with the
principles set forth in Appendix I1.2.

ll.2.16 Establishment and identification of standard routes for taxiing aircraft

11.2.16.1 Mrere necessary, standard routes for taxiing aircraft shall be established on an
aerodrome between runways, aprons and maintenance areas. Such routes should be direct,
simple and where practicable, designed to avoid ffaffic ccnflicts.

11.2.16.2 Standard routes for taxiing aircraft shall be identified by designators distinctively
different from those ofthe runways and ATS routes.

11,.2.17 Coordination between the operator and air trafric seivices

11.2.17.1Air traffic services units, in carrying out their objectives, shall have due regard for
the requirements of flre oprators consequent on their obligations as specified in PCAR Part 8
and, if so required by the operators, shall make available to them or their designated

representatives such information as may be available to enable thern or their designated
representatiyes to carry out their responsibilities.

TI.2.17.2 When so requested by an operator, messages (including position reports) received by
air traffic services units and relating to the operation of the aircraft for which operational
control service is provided by that operator shall, so far as practicable, be made available
immediately to the operator or a designated representative in accordance with locally agreed

procedures.

11.2.18 Coordination between military authorities and air trallic services

11.2.18.1 Air traffic services authorities shall establish and maintain close cooperation with
military authorities responsible for activities that may affect flights of civil aircraft.

11.2.18.2 Coordination of activities potentially hazardous to civil aircraft shall be effected in
accordance with 1 1.2. 19.

11.2.18.3 Arrangements shall be made to permit information relevant to the safe and

expeditious conduct of flights of civil aircraft to be promptly exchanged between air traffic
services units and appropriate military units.
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11.2.18.3.1 Air taffic services units shall, either routinely or on request, in accordance with
locally agreed procedures, provide appropriate military units with pertinent flight plan and
other data concerning flights of civil aircraft. In order to eliminate or reduce the need for
interceptions, air &affic services authorities shall designate any areils or routes where the
requirements of CAR Part I concerning flight plans, two-way communications and position
reporting apply to all flights to ensure that all pertinent data is available in appropriate air
traffic services units specifically for the purpose of faciliating identification of civil aircraft.

11.2.78.3.2 Special procedures shall be established in order to ensure that:

a) air traffic services units are notified if a military unit observes that an aircraft which is, or
might be, a civil aircraft is approaching, or has entered, any area in which interception might
become necessary;

b) all possible efforts are made to confirm the identity of the aircraft and to provide it with the
navigational guidance necessary to avoid the need for interception.

ll.2.l9 Coordination of activitie potcntially hazardous to civil aircraft

Il.2.l9.l The arrangements for activities potentially hazardous to civil aircraft, whether over
the territory of the Republic of the Philippines or over the high seas, shall be coordinated with
the appropriate air traffic services authorities. The coordination shall be effected early enough
to permit timely promulgation of infonnation regarding the activities in accordance with the
provisions of CAR-ANS Part 15.

ll.2.lg-T.L If the appropriate ATS authoriff is not that of the Philippines where the
organization planning the activities is located, initial coordination shall be effected through the
ATS authoriff responsible for the airspace over the State where the organization is located.

11.2.19.2 The objective of the coordination shall be to achieve the best arrangements which
will avoid hazards to civil aircraft and minimize interference with the normal operations of
such aircraft.

11.2.19.2.1In determining these iurangements the following shall be applied

a) the locations or areas, times and durations for the activities shall be selected to avoid closure
or realignment of established ATS routes, blocking of the most economic flight levels, or
delays of scheduled aircraft operations, unless no other options exist;

b) the size of the airspace designated for the conduct of the activities shall be kept as small as

possible;

c) direct communication between the appropriate ATS authority or air traffic services unit and

the organization or turit conducting the activities shall be provided for use in the event that civil
aircraft emergencies or other unforeseen circumstances require discontinuation of the activities.

11.2.19.3 The appropriate ATS authorities shall be responsible for initiating the promulgation
of information regarding the activities.
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11.7.19.4 If activities potertially hazardous to civil aircraft take place on a regular or
continuing basis, special committees shall be established as required to ensure that the
requirements of all parties concerned are adequately coordinated.

11.2.19.5 Adequate steps shall be taken to prevent emission of laser beams from adversely
affectin g fl ight operations.

11.2.19.6 [n order to provide added airspace capacity and to improve efficiency and flexibilify
of aircraft operations, CAAP shall establish procedures providing for a flexible use of airspace
reserved for military or other special activities. The procedures should permit all airspace users
to have safe access to such reserved airspace.

ll.2.20 Aeronautical data

11.2.20.1Determination and reporting of air traffic services'related aeronautical data shall be
in accordance with the accuracy and integrity requirements set forth in Tables I to 5 contained
in Appendix ll.5 while taking into account the established qualiqr system procedures.
Accuracy requirements for aeronautical data are based upor a 95 per cent confidence level, and
in that respect three types of positional data shall be identified: surveyed points (e.g. navigation
aids positions), calculated points (mathematical calculations from the known surveyed points
of points in space, fixes) and declared points (e.g. flight information regron boundary points).

11.2.20.2 The CAAP shall ensure that integrity of aeronautical data is maintained throughout
the data pro@ss from surveylorigin to the next intended user. Based on the applicable integrity
classifi cation, the validation procdure shall :

1I.2.2A3 Electronic aeronautical data sets, shall be protected by the inclusion in the data sets
of a 32-bit cyclic redundancy check (CRC) implemented by the application dealing with the
data sets. This shall apply to the protection of all integriff levels of data sets as specified in
tL.2.24.2.

11.2.20.4 Geographical coordinates indicating latitude and longitude shall be determined and
reported to flre aeronautical information services authority in terms of the World Geodetic
System - 1984 (WGS-84) geodetic reference datum, identifying those geographical
coordinates which have been transformed into WGS-84 coordinates by mathematical rneans

and whose accuracy of original field work does not meet the s in Appendix 11.5,

Table 1.

n.2.2A.5 The order of accuracy of the field work and detenninations and calculations derived

therefrom shall be such that the resulting operational navigation data for the phases of fligltt
will be within the maximum deviations, with respect to an appropriate reference frame, as

indicated in the tables containd in Appendix 11.5.

Note l.- An appropriate reference frame is that wltich enables WGS-84 to be realized on a
given position andwith respect towhich all coordinate data are related.

Note 2.- Specifications governing the publication of aeronaulical data are given in CAR-ANS
Part 15,11.3.
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Note 3.- For those.ftxes and points thot are serving a dual purpose, e.g. holding point and
m i s sed approoch point, the hi gher ac curocy applies.

ll.2.2l Coordination between meteorological and air traffic services authorities

ll.2.2l.l To ensure that aircraft receive the most up-to-date meteorological information for
aircraft operations, arrangements shall be made, where necessary, between meteorological and
air traffic services authorities for air traffic services personnel:

a) in addition to using indicating instruments, to report, if observed by air faffic services
personnel or communicated by aircraft, such other meteorological elements as may be agreed

upon;

b) to report as soon as possible to the associated rneteorological office meteorological
phenomena of operational significance, if observed by air traffic services persorurel or
communicated by aircraft, which have not been included in the aerodrome meteorological
report;

c) to report as soon as possible to the associated meteorological office pertinent information
concerning pre-emption volcanic activity, volcanic eruptions and information concerning
volcanic ash cloud. In addition, area conffol centers and flight information centers shall report
the information to the associated rneteorological watch office and volcanic ash advisory centers
(VAACS).

11.2.21.2 Close coordination shall be maintained between area control centers, flight
inforrnation crcnters and associated meteorological watch offices to ensure that information on
volcanic ash included in NOTAM and SIGMET messages is consistent.

11.2.22 Coordination between aeronautical information services and air traf;Ec services
authorities

11.2.22.1To ensure that aeronautical information services turits obtain information to enable
them to provide up-to-date pre-flight information and to meet the need for in- flight
infonnation, arrangements shall be made between aeronautical infonnation services and air
traffic services authorities responsible for air traffic services to report to the responsible
aeronautical information services turit, with a mfirimum of delay:

a) infonnation on aerodrome conditions,

b) the operational status of associated facilities, services and navigation aids within their area

of responsibility;
c) the occurrence of volcanic activity observed by air traffEc seryices persormel or reported by

aircraft; and

d) any other information considered to be of operational significance.

11.2.22.2 Before introducing changes to the air navigation system, due account shall be taken
by the services responsible for such changes of the time needed by the aeronautical information
service for the preparation, production and issuance of relevant material for promulgation. To
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ensure timely provision of the information to the aeronautical information service, close
coordination between those services concerned is therefore required.

11.2.22.3 Of particular importance are changes to aeronautical infonnation that affect charts
and/or computer-based navigation systems which qualify to be notified by the Aeronautical
Information Regulation and Control (AIRAC) system, as specified in CAR-ANS Part 15,
I 1.1 l 6 and Appendix 1l.4). The predetermined, internationally agreed AIRAC effective dates
in addition to 14 days postage time shall be observed by the responsible air traffic services
when submitting the raw information/data to aeronautical information services.

L1.2.22.4 The air traffic services responsible for the provision of raw aeronautical
information/data to the aeronautical infonnation services shall do so while taking into account
accuracy and integrity requirements for aeronautical data as specified in Appendix t 1.5 to this
CAR-ANS Part 11.

Note l.- Specifications for the issue oJ'a NOTAM and ASHTAM are contoined in CAR-ANS
Part 15, lI.5).

Note 2.- Reports of volcanic activity comprise the information detailed in CAR-ANS Part 3, I I
1 and LOA omong Phivolcs, Pagasa, & CAAP.

Note 3.- AIRAC information is distributed by the qeroncutical infarmation service at leasl 42
days in advance of the AIRAC effective dates with the objective of reoching recipients at least
28 days in advonce of'the eflbctive date.

Note 4. - The schedule o/'the predetermined, internationally agreed AIRAC common effictive
dates at intervals of 28 days antl guidance.fbr the AIRAC use are contained in the Aeronaulical
Information Services Manual (Doc 8126, Chapter 2, 2.6).

11.2.23 Minimum flight altitudes

Minimtun flight altitudes shall be determined and promulgated by CAAP for each ATS route
and conffol area over the territory of the Republic of the Philippines. The minimum flight
altitudes determined shall provide a minimum clearance above the controlling obstacle located
within the areas concerned.

Note.- The requirements -for ptblication by CAAP regarding minimum .flight altitudes and
criteria used ta determine them are contained in CAR-ANS Part l5, Appendix I.

11.2.24 Service to aircraft in the event of an emergency

11.2.24.1 An aircraft larown or believed to be in a state of emergency, including being
subjected to unlawful interference, shall be given maximum consideration, assistance and
prioriff over other aircraft as may be necessitated by the circumstances.

Note.- To indicate thct it is in a state af emetg{ency, an aircrafl equipped with an appropriate
datalink capability and'or SSR tran.sponder might operate the equipment as.follows:

a) on Mode A, Code 770A; or
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b) on Mode A, Code 7500, ta indicale specrfically that il is being suhjected to unlawful
interference; and,ar
c) activate tke appropriale emergency andt'or urgency capabili4t of ADS-B or ADS-C; sndior
d) transmit the appropriate emergency message via CPDLC.

11.2.24.LI In communications between ATS units and aircraft in the event of an emergency,
Human Factors principles shall be observed.

Note.- Guidsnce material on Human Factors principles can be found in the Human Factors
Training Manual (Doc 9683).

11.2.24.2 When an occurence of unlawful interference with an aircraft takes place or is
suspected, ATS tutits shall attend promptly to requests by the aircraft. Information pertinent to
the safe conduct of the flight shall continue to be transmitted and necessary action shall be
taken to expedite the conduct of all phases of flre flight, especially the safe landing of the
aircraft.

It.2.24.3 When an occurronce of unlawful interference with an aircraft takes place or is
suspected, ATS tutits shall, in accordance with locally agreed procedures, immediately inform
the appropriate authority designated by CAAP and exchange necessary information wiflr the
operator or its designated representative.

Note. l- A strayed or unidentified aircraft may be suspected as being the suhject oJ'unlawJul
interference. See I 1.2.25.1.3.

Note 2.- Procedures relating to the handling of strayed or unidentified aircraft are contained
in I L2.25.1.

Note 3.- The MOS-ATS, Chapler 15, 15.1.3 contains more specific procedares related to
unlawful intederence.

11.2.25 In-fl ight eontingencies

11.2.25.1 Strayed or unidentified aircraft

Note 1.- The terms "strayed aircraft" and "unidentified aircraft" in this poragraph have lhe

following meanings:

Strayed aircraft. An aircraft which has deviated significantly.from its intended track or which
reporls thal it is lost.

Unidenti/ied aircrafi. An aircraft which has been obserued or reported to be operating in a
given area but whose identity has not been established.

Note 2.- An aircrafi may be considered, at the same time, os a "strayed aircraJi" by one unit
and as an "unidentified aircraft" by another unit.

Note 3. - A strayed or unidentified aircrafi rnay be -suspected as betng the ,suhject oJ'unlawJul

interJbrence.
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11.2.25.1.1 As soon as an air traffic services urit becomes aware of a sfrayed aircraft it shall
take all necessary steps as outlined n 11.2.24.1.1.1 and 11.2.24.1.1.2 to assist the aircraft and
to safeguard its flight.

Note.- Navigatiornl assistonce by on air traffic services unit is particularly important if the
unit becomes oware of an aircraft straying, or about to stray, into an areawhere there is a risk
of interception or other hamrd b its safe4t.

11.2.25.1.1.1 If the aircraft's position is not ftnown, the air traffic services unit shall:

a) attempt to establish two-way communication with the aircraft, wfess such comrnunication
already exists;

b) use all available meims to determine its position;

c) inform other ATS units into whose area the aircraft may have sffayed or may stray, taking
into arcount all the factors which may have affected the navigation of the aircraft in the
circumstances,

d) infornr" in accordance with locally agreed procedures, appropriate military rmits and provide
them with pertinent flight plan and other data concerning strayed aircraft;

e) request from &e units referred to in c) and d) and from other aircraft in flight every
assistance in establishing communication with the aircraft and determining its position.

Note.- The requirements in d) and e) dpply also to ATS units informed in accordance with c).

11.2.25.1.1.2 When the aircraft's position is established, the air traffic seryices unit shall:

a) advise the aircraft of its position and corrective action to be taken; and

b) provide, as necessary, other ATS units and appropriate military units with relevant
information concerning the strayed aircraft and any advice glven to that aircraft.

11.2.25.1.2 As soon as an air traffic services unit becomes aware of an unidentified aircraft in
its area, it shall endeavor to establish the identity of the aircraft whenever this is necessary for
the provision of air traffic services or required by the appropriate military authorities in
accordance with locally agreed procedures. To this end, the air traffic services unit shall take
such of the following steps as are appropriate in the circumstances:

a) attempt to establish two-way communication wiflr the aircraft;

b) inquire of other air traffic services urits within the flight information region about the flight
and request their assistance in establishing two-way communication with the aircraft;

c) inquire of air traffic services units serving the adjacent fliglrt information regions about the

flight and request their assistance in establishing tlryo-way communication with the aircraft;

d) attempt to obtain information from other aircraft in the area.

11.2.25.1.2.1 The air traffic services unit shall, as necessary, inform the appropriate military
unit as soon as the identity of the aircraft has been established.

11.2.25.1.3 Should the ATS unit consider that a strayed or unidentified aircraft may be the

subject of unlawful interference, the appropriate authority designated by CAAP shall

irnmediately be informed, in accordance with locally agreed procedures.
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I I .2.25.2 Interception of civil aircraft

11.2.25.2.1As soon as an air traffic services unit learns that an aircraft is being intercepted in
its area of responsibility, it shall take such of the following steps as are appropriate in the
circumstances:

a) attempt to establish two-way communication with the intercepted aircraft via any means
available, including the emergency radio frequency 121.5 MHz, unless such communication
already exists;

b) inform the pilot ofthe intercepted aircraft of flre interception;

c) establish contact with the intercept conffol unit maintaining two-way cofiununication with
the intercepting aircraft and provide it with available informafion conceming the aircraft;

d) relay messages between the intercepting aircraft or the intercept control unit and the
intercepted aircraft, as necessary;

e) in close coordination with the intercept conffol unil take all necessary steps to ensure the
safety of the intercepted aircraft;

f) inform ATS units serving adjacent flight information regions if it appears that the aircraft has
strayed from such adjacent flight information regions.

1T.2.25.2.2 As soon as an air traffic services unit learns that an aircraft is being intercepted
outside its area of responsibility, it shall take suchof the following steps as are appropriate in
the circumstances:

a) inform the ATS unit serving the airspace in which the interception is taking place, providing
this unit with available information that will assist in identifiing the akcraft and requesting it
to take action in accordance with 11.2"25.2.1;

b) relay messages between the intercepted aircraft and the appropriate ATS unit, the intercept
control unit or &e intercepting aircraft.

11.2,26 Time in air traffic services

11,.2.26.1 Air taffic services units shall use Coordinated Universal Tirne (UTC) and shall
express the time in hours and minutes and, when required, seconds of the 24- hour day
beginning atmidnight.

11.2.26.2 Air traffic services units shall be equipped with clocks indicating the time in hours,
minutes and seconds, clearly visible from each operating position in the urit concerned.

11.2.26.3 Air traffic services unit clocks and other time-recording devices shall be checked as

necessary to ensure correct time to withh plus or minus 30 seconds of UTC. Wherever data
link communications are utilized by an air traffic services unit, clocks and other time-recording
devices shall be checked as necessary to ensure correct time to lvithin I second of UTC.

11.2.?6.4 The corr*t time shall be obtained from a skndard time station or, if not possible,

from another unit which has obtained the correct time from such station.

11.2.26.5 Aerodrome control towers shall, prior to an aircraft taxiing for take-ofi provide pilot
with the correct time, unless arrangements have been made for the pilot to obtain it from other
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sources. Air traffic services units shall, in addition, provide aircraft with the correct time on
request. Time checks shall be given to the nearest half rninute.

1.2.27 Establishment of requirements for cariage and operation of pressure- altitude
reporting transponders

ll.2.27.1CAAP shall establish requirernents for carriage and operation of pressure- altitude
reporting transponders within defined portions of airspace.

Note.- This provision is intendetl lo improve lhe effectiveness oJ'air traffic services as well as
ai rb o rne col I i s i on svoi dance sys tem s.

11,.2.28 Fatigue mauagement

Note.-- Guidance on the development and implementation of-fatigue monagement regulations
is contained in lhe Manaal for the Oversight of Fatigue Management Approaches (Doc 9966).

a) regulations that prescribe scheduling limits in accordance with Appendix I 1.6; and

b) where authorizing air traffic services providers tc use a fatigue risk managernent system
(FRMS) to manage fatigue, FRMS regulations in accordance with Appendix 11.7.

71.2.?8.2 CAAP shall require that the air traffic services provider, for the purposes of
managing its fatigue-related safety risks, establish one of the following:

a) air traffic controller schedules commensurate with the service(s) provided and in compliance
with the prescriptive limitation regulations established by CAAP in accordance with 11.2.28.1
a); or

b) an FRMS, in compliance with regulations established by CAAP in accordance with
I 1.2.28.1 b), for flre provision of all air traffic control services; or

c) an FRMS, in compliance with regulations established by CAAP in accordance with
11.2.28.1b), for a defined part of its air traffic control services in conjunction with schedules
in compliance with the prescriptive limitation regulations established by CAAP in accordance
with I 1.2.28.1a) for the remainder of its air traffic confol services.

11.2.28.3 Where the air traffic services provider complies with prescriptive limitation
regulations in the provision of part or all of its air traffic control services in accordance with
11.2.28.2 a), CAAP:

a) shall require evidence that the limitaticns are not exceeded and that non-duty period
requirements are met;

b) shall require that the air traffic services provider familiarize its personnel with the principles
of fatigue management and its policies with regard to fatigue m{magement;
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c) shall establish a process to allow variations from the prescriptive limitation regulations to
address any additional risks associated with sudden, unforeseen operational circtunstances; and

d) may approve variations to these regulations using an established process in order to address
strategic operational needs in exceptional circumstances, based on the air traffic services
provider demonstrating that any associated risk is being managed to a level of safey equivalent
to, or better than, that achieved through the prescriptive fatigue management regulations.

Note.-- Complying with the prescriptive limitations regulations does not relieve the air traffic
service.s provider of tlte responsibility to monage its riskg, includingfatigte-related risks, using
its SMS in accordance with the pravisions oJ'Annex 19.

11.2.28.4 Where an air traffic services provider implements an FRMS to manage fatigue-
related safety risks in the provision of part or all of its air traffic control services in accordance
with I l.?.28.2 b), CAAP shall:

a) require the air traffic services provider to have processes to integrate FRMS f,urctions with
its other safety management fi.rnctions; and

b) approve an FRMS, according to a documented process, that provides a level of safeff
acceptable to CAAP.

Note.-- Provi.sions on the protection of safety infotmation, which support the continued
availability oJ'information required by an FRMS, cre contained in Annex 19.

11.2.29 ATS safety management

Note. - Annex 19 inchdes the safety mdndgemeTtt pruvisions applicable to ATS providers.
Further guidance is contained tn the Safety Management Manual {SMM) (Doc 9859) and
associated procedures are contained in the Manual of Standards .for Air Trafic Services

Mos-ATS).

11.2.29.1 Any significant safety-related change to the ATS system, including the
implementation of a reduced separation minimum or a new procedrue, shall only be effected

after a safery assessment has demonstrated that an acceptable level of safety will be met and

users have been consulted. When appropriate, CAAP shall ensure that adequate provision is

made for post-implernentation monitoring to verify that the defined level of safety contimres to
be met.

Note. - When, due ta the nature of the change, the acceptable level of safety cannot be

expressed in quantitative terms, the sa/bty assessment may rely on operational judgment.

11.2.29.2 The applicable level of safeff to be achieved shall be established by the CAAP.

Note. - (iuidance on deJining acceptable levels aJ'safery is contained in the Safety Management
Manual (SMM) (Doc. 9859).

11.2.29.3 CAAP shall require, as part of their safety program, that an air traffic services
provider implernents a safety management system acceptable to the CAAP that, as a minimum;

a) identifies safey hazards;

b) ensures the Implementation of remedial action necessary to maintain agreed safety
performance;
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c) provides for continuous monitoring and regular assessment of the safety perfonnance; and
d) afuns a continuous improvernent of the overall performance of the ffifety management
system.

T1.2.29.4 A safety management system shall clearly define lines of safety accountabili[r
throughout the air traffic services provider, including direct accountabilrty for safety on the
part of senior management.

Note. -The .framework .far the implernentation arul mainlenance of a saJbty management
system is contained in Appendix I1.6. Guidnnce on safety manogement systems is contained in
the ATS SaJAry Management Syslems Manual and associated prucedt$es are contained in the
Mamml of Standnrdsfor ATS (MOS-AT$.

11.2.30 Common reference systems

ll .2 3A.l Horizontal reference system

World Geodetic System - 1984 (WGS-84) shall be used as a horizontal (geodetic) reference
system for air navigation. Reported aeronautical geographical coordinates (indicating latitude
and longitude) shall be expressed in tenns of the WGS-84 geodetic reference datum.

12.2.30.2 Vertical reference system

Mean sea level (MSL) datum, which gives relationship of gravity-related height (elevation) to
a surface known as the geoid, shall be used as the vertical reference system for air navigation.

Note.-The Geoid globally most clo,sely approximales MSL. h is delined as tke equipotential
surface in the gravity field af the Earth which coincides with the undisturbed MSL extended
continuously through the continents.

I I.2.30.3 Temporal reference system

11.2.30.3.1 The Gregorian calendar and Coordinated Universal Time (UTC) shall be used as

the temporal reference system for air navigation.

11.23A3.2 When a different temporal reference system is used, this shall be indicated in GEN
2.1.2 of Aeronautical Information Publication (AIP).

ll.2.3l Language proficiency

11.2.31.1 An air traffic services provider shall ensure that air raffic confrollers speak and
understand the language(s) used for radiotelephony commrmications as specified in PCAR Part
2.

11.2.31.2 Except when communications between air taffic control units are conducted in a
mutually agreed language, the English language shall be used for such communications.

11.2.32 Contingency arrangements

Air traffic services authorities shall develop and promtrlgate contingency plans for
implementation in the event of disruption, or potential disruption, of air traffic services and
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related supporting services in the airspace for which they are responsible for the provision of
such services. Such contingency plans shall be developed with the assistance of ICAO as
necessary, in close coordination with the air traffic services authorities responsible for the
provision of services in adjacent portions of airspace and with airspace users concerned.

Note l. - Cntidance material relating to the develapment, promulgation and implementotion of
contingency plans is contained in Attachment I lC.

Note 2.- Contingency plans may constitute a temporary deviationfrom the approved regianal
air navigation plans; such deviations are approved, as necessary, by the President of the ICAO
Council on behalf of'the Council.

ll.2SS ldentification and delineation of prohibited, restricted and dangcrureas

1I.2.33-l Each prohibited area, restricted area, or danger area established by CAAP shall, upon
initial establishment, be given an identification and filll details shall be promulgated.

Note.- See CAR-ANS Part 15, Appendix l5A, ENR 5.1.

11.2.33.2 The identification so assigned shall be used to identify the area in all subsequent
notifications pertaining to that area.

11.2.33.3 The identification shall be composed of a group of letters and figrrres as follows:
a) nationality letters for location indicators assigned to the state or territory which has
established the airspace.

b) A letter P for prohibited area, R for restricted area and D for danger area as appropriate; and

c) A number, trnduplicated within the State orterritory concerned.

Note.-- Nationality letters are those contained in Location lrulicators (Doc 7910).

11.2.33.4 To avoid confusion, identification numbers shall not be reused for a period of at least
ons year after cancellation of the area to which they refer.

11.2.33.5 When a prohibited, resfficted or danger area is established, the area shall be as small
as practicable and be contained within simple geometrical limits, so as to permit ease of
reference by all concerned.

11.2.34 Instrument flight procedure design service

CAAP shall ensure that an instrument flight procedure design service is in place in accordance

with Appendix 11.8.

11.3 AIR TRAFFIC CONTROL SERVICE

11.3.3 Operation of air tra{fic control service
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11.3.3.3 Air traffic control units shall be equipped with devices that record background
communication and aural environment at air traffic controller work stations, capable of
retaining the information recorded during at least the last twenty-four hours of operation

11.3.3.5.1 For all airspace where reduced vertical separation minimum of 300 m (1000ft) is
applied between FI.2W and FL 410 inclusive, a program shall be instituted, on a regional
basis, for monitoring the height-keeping performance of aircraft operating at these levels, in
order to ensure that the continued application of this vertical separation minimum meets the
safety objectives. The scope of regional monitoring prograrnmes shall be adequate to conduct
analyses of aircraft Soup performance and evaluate the stability of altirnetry systern error.

Note.- Guidsnce material relating to vertical separatitm and monitonng of heighbkeeping
performance is contained in the Mamral on Implementation of a 300 rn (l 000 ft) Yertical
Separation Minimum Between FL2gfi and FL 410 Inclusive (Doc 9574).

11.3.3.5.2 Where RCPIRSP specifications are applied, programmes shall be instituted for
monitoring the perforrnance of the infrastructure and the participating aircraft against the
appropriate RCP andlor RSP specifications, to ensure that operations in the applicable airspace
continue to meet safes objectives. The scope of monitoring prograrnmes shall be adequate to
evaluate communication and/or surveillance performance, as applicable.

Note.-- Guidance material relating ta RCP arul RSP specificalions and monitoring of
cornmunicotion and sarveillance per{ormance is contained in the Perforrnance-based
Cornmurication and Surveillance (PBCS) Manual (Doc 9869).

1 1.3.3.5.3 Arrangements shall be put in place through inter regional agreement, for the sharing
between regions of data monitoring programs.

11.3.4 Separation minima

3.4.1 The selection of separation minima for application within a given portion of airspace

shall be as follows:

a) the separation minima shall be selected from those prescribed by the provisions of the

Manual of Standards for Air Traffic Services (MOS-ATS) and the Regional Supplementary

Procedures as applicable urder the prevailing circumstances except thaq where types of aids

are used or circumstances prevail which are not covered by current ICAO provisions, other

separation rninima shall be established as necessary by:

1) the appropriate ATS authority, following consultation with operators, for routes or portions

of routes contained within the sovereign airspace of a State;

2) regional air navigation agreements for routes or portions of routes contained within airspace

over the high seas or over areas of undetermiiled sovereignty.

Note. -- Details af current separation minima prescribed by the Republic of the Philippines
are contained in the MOS-ATS and r&e Regional Supplementary Procedures (Doc 7A3q.

11.3.7 .1.2 Standard departure and arrival routes and associated procedures shall be established

when necessary to facilitate:
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L1.3.7.2.? The air traffic control clearance relating to the transonic deceleration and descent of
an aircraft from supersonic cruise to subsonic flight shall provide for unintemrpted descent, at
least during the transonic phase.

11.3.7.3 Read-back of clearances and safety-related infonnation

11.3.7.3.1 The flight crew shall read back to the air traffic controller safety-related parts of
ATC clearances and instructions which are fransmitted by voice. The following items shall
always be read back:

a) ATC route clearances;

b) clearances and instructions to enter, land on, take offon, hold short of, cross and backtrack
on any runway; and

c) runway-in-use, altimeter settings, SSR c.odes, level instructions, heading and speed
instructions and, whether issued by the controller or contained in ATIS broadcasts, transition
levels.

11.3.7.3.2 Unless specified by the appropriate ATS authority, voice read-back of CPDLC
messages shall not be required.

Note.- The procedures and provisions relating to the exchange and acknowledgement of
CPDLC messages are contained in CAR-ANS Part 2, and the MOS-ATS, Chapter 11.

11.3.7 .4 Coordination of clearances

1I.3.7.4.1 An aircraft shall be cleared for the entire route to the aerodrome of first intended

landing:

a) when it has been possible, prior to departure, to coordinate the clearance between all the

units under whose gonffol the aircraft will come; or

b) when there is reasonahle assurance that prior coordination will be effected between those

units rurder whose control the aircraft will subsequently come; or

Note.- Were a clearance is issued covering the initial part of the .flight solely as a means of
expediting departing trffic, the sacceeding en-route clmrance will be as specified above even

though the aerodrome af first intended landing is under the jurisdiction of an area control

cenler other than the one issuing the en-rutute clearance.
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An air faffic control clearance shall be coordinated between air faffic control units to cover
the entire route of an aircraft or a specified portion thereof as follows:

11.3.7.4.2.1.4 Where practicable, and where datalink communications are used to facilitate

downsffeam clearance delivery, two-way voice communications between the pilot and the air
traffic control unit providing the downstream clearance shall be available.



71.3.7 .5.2 ATFM shall be implernented on the basis of regional air navigation agreements oE if
appropriated, through multilateral agreements. Such agrcements shall make provision for
cofllmon procedures and common methods of capacity determination.

11.3.8 Control of persons and vehicles at aerodromes

11.3.8.1 The movement of persons or vehicles including towed aircraft on the maneuvering
area of an aerodrome shall be controlled by the aerodrome contol tower as necessary to avoid
hazard to them or to aircraft landing, taxiing or taking off

3.8.2 In conditions where low visibility procedures are in operation:

a) persons and vehicles operating on the manoeuwing area of an aerodrorne shall be restricted
to the essential minimum, and particular regard shall be given to the requirements to protect the
ILS/MLS sensitive area(s) when Category II or Category III precision instrument operations
are in progress;

b) subject to the provisions in 3.8.3. the minimum separation between vehicles and taxiing
aircraft shall be as prescribed by the appropriate ATS authority taking into account the aids

available;

c) when mixed ILS and MLS Category II or Category III precision instrument operations are

taking place to the same rumray continuously, the more restrictive ILS or MLS critical and

sensitive areas shall be protected.

Note. - The period of applicatian af krw visibility procedures is determined in accordance
witlt ATS unit instructions. Guidance on low visibility operatioru,s on an aerodrame is contained
in theManual of Surface Movement Guidance and Control Systems (SMGCS) (Doc 9476).

11.3.8.3 Emergency vehicles proceeding to &e assistance of an aircraft in distress shall be

afforded priority over all other surface movement traffic.

11.3.8.4 Subject to the provisions in 11.3.8.3, vehicles on the maneuvering area shall be
required to comply with the following rules:

a) vehicles and vehicles towing aircraft shall give way to aircraft which are landing, taking off
or taxiing;

b) vehicles shall give way to other vehicles towing aircraft;

c) vehicles shall give way to other vehicles in accordance with ATS unit instructions;

d) notwithstanding the provisions of a), b) and c), vehicles and vehicles towing aircraft shall
comply with instructions issued by the aerodrome control tower.

11.3.9 Provision of radar and ADS-B

Radar and ADS-B ground systems shall provide for the display of safety-related alefis and

warnings, including conflict alert, conflict prediction, minimurn safe altitude warning and

unintentionally duplicated SSR codes.

11,3.10 Use of surface movement radar (SMR)
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In the absence of visual observation of all or part of the maneuvering area or to supplement
visual observations, surface movement radar (SMR) provided in accordance with the
provisions of Manual of Standards for Aerodromes or other suitable surveillance equipment,
should be utilized to:

a) monitor the movements of aircraft and vehicles on the maneuvering area;

b) provide directional information to pilots and vehicle drivers as necessary; and

c) provide advice and assistance for the safe and efficient movement of aircraft and vehicles on
the maneuvering area.

Note. -- See the Manual of Surface Movement Guidance and Control Systems (SMGCS) (Doc
9476), the Advanced Surface Movement Guidance and Control Systems (A-SMGCS) Manual
(Doc 9830) and the Air Traffic Services Planning Manual (Doc 9426) for guidance on the use
of SMR.

11.4 FLIGHT INFORMATION SERVICE

ll.4.l Application

11.4.2.3 ATS units shall transmit, as soon as practicable, special air-reports to other aircraft
concerned, to the associated meteorological office, and to other ATS units concemed.
Transmissions to aircraft shall be continued for a period to be determined by agreement
between the meteorological and air traffic services authorities concerned.

11.4.3 Operational flight information service broadcasts

11.4.3.1 Application

11.4.3.1.1. The meteorological infonnation and operational information concerning radio
navigation services and aerodromes included in the flight information service shall, whenever

available, be provided in an operationally integrated form.

11.4.3.1.2 Where integrated operational flight information messages are to be ffansmitted to
aircraft, they shall be transmitted with the content and, where specified, in the sequence

indicated, for the various phases of flight.

11.4.3.1.3 Operational flight information service broadcasts, when provided, shall consist of
messages containing integrated information regarding selected operational and meteoroiogical
elements appropriate to the various phases of flight. These broadcasts shall be of three major
types, i.e. HF, VHF and ATIS.

11.4.3.2 HF operational flight information service (OFIS) broadcasts

11.4.3.2.1HF operational flight infonnation seryice (OFIS) broadcasts shall be provided when

it has been determined by regional air navigation agreements that a requirement exists.

11.4.3.2.2 Whenever such broadcasts are provided:
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a) the information shall be in acmrdance with 4.3.2.5, as applicable, subject to regional air
navigation agreements;

b) the aerodromes for which reports and forecasts are to be included shall be as determined by
regional air navigation agleements;

c) the time-sequencing of stations participating in the broadcast shall be as determined by
regional air navigation agteements;

d) the HF OFIS broadcast message shall take into consideration human perfonnance. The
broadcast message shall not exceed the length of time allocated for it by regional air navigation
agreements, care being taken that the readabiliff is not impaired by the speed of the
transmission;

e) each aerodrome message shall be identified by the name of the aerodrome to which the
information applies;

f) when information has not been received in time for a broadcast, the latest available
information shall be included together with the time of that observation;

g) the firll broadcast shall be repeated if this is feasible within the remainder of the time allotted
to the broadcasting station;

h) the broadcast information shall be updated immediately if a significant change occurs; and

i) the HF OFIS message shall be prepared and disseminated by the most appropriate udt(s) as

designated by CAAP.

11.4.3.2.3 Pending the development and adoption of a more suitable fonn of speech for
universal use in aeronautical radiotelephony communications, HF OFIS broadcasts concerning
aerodromes designated for use by international air services shall be available in the English
language.

11.4.3.2.4 Where HF OFIS broadcasts are available in more than one language, a discrete
channel shall be used for each language.

11.4.3.2.5 HF operational flight information service broadcast messages shall contain the

following information in the sequence indicated or as determined by regional air navigation

agreements:

a) En-route weather information

Information on significant en-route weather phenomena shall be in flre form of available

SIGMET as prescribed in CAR-ANS Part 3.

11.4.3.3 VHF operational flight information service (OFIS) broadcasts

11.4.3.3.1 YHF operational flight information service broadcasts shall be provided as

determined by regional air navigation agreoments.

11.4.3.3.2 Whenever such broadcasts are provided:

a) the aerodromes for which reports and forecasts are to be included shall be as determined by

regional air navigation agreements;
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b) each aerodrome message shall be identified by the name of the aerodrome to which the

information applies;

c) when information has not been received in time for a broadcast, the latest available

information shall be included together with the time of that observation;

d) the broadcasts shall be continuous and repetitive;

e) the YHF OFIS broadcast message shall take into consideration human perfomrance. The

broadcast message shall, whenever practicable, not exceed five minutes, care being taken that

the readability is not impaired by the speed of the transmission,

f) the broadcast message shall be updated on a scheduled basis as determined by regional air
agreements. In addition it shall be expeditiously updated immediately if a siguificant change

occurs; and

g) the VHF OFIS message shall be prepared and disseminated by the most appropriate unit(s)
as designated by CAAP.

11.4.3.3.3 Pending the developrnent and adoption of a rnore suitable fonn of speech for
universal use in aeronautical radiotelephony communications, VH OFIS broadcasts concerning
aerodromes designated for use by international air services shall be available in the English
language.

11.4.3.3.4 Where VHF OFIS broadcasts are available in more than one language, a discrete
channel shall be used for each langrrage.

11.4.3.3.5 VHF operational flight information service broadcast me$sages shall contain the
following information in the sequence indicated:

a) name of aerodrome;
b) time of observation
c) landingrunway
d) sigdficant runway surface conditions and, if appropriate, braking action;
e) changes in the operational state ofthe radio navigation services, if appropriate;
f) holding delay, if appropriate;
g) surface wind direction and speed; if appropriate, maximum wind speed;
*h) visibility and, when a
*i) present weather;
*j) cloud below 1500 m (5 000 ft) or below the highest minimum sector altitude, whichever is

greater; cumulonimbus; if the sky is obscured, vertical visibiliSr, when available;
**k) air temperature;
**l) dew point temperature;
**m) QNH altimeter setting
n) supplernentary information on recent weather of operational significance and, where

necessary, wind shear;

o) trend forecast, when available; and
p) notice of current SIGMET messages
*These elements are replaced by the term "CAVOK" whenever the conditions as specified in
the MOS-ATS, Chapter 1l prevail.
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**As determined on the basis of regional air navigation agreements

11.4.3.4.7 Where Voice-ATIS broadcasts are available in more than one language, a discrete
channel shall be used for each language.

11.4.3.4.8 The Voice-ATIS broadcasts message shall, whenever practicable, not exceed 30
seconds, care being taken that the readability of the ATIS message is not impaired by the speed
of the transmission or by the identification signal of a navigation aid used for transmission of
ATIS. The ATIS broadcast message shall take into consideration human perfonnance.

11.4.3.5 Data link-automatic terminal information service (D-ATIS)

4.3.5.1.1 Where real-time meteorological information is included but the data remains within
the parameters of the significant change criteria, the content, for the purpose of maintaining the
same designator, shall be considered identical

Note. *- Significant change criteria are specified in CAR-ANS Part 3, 3.2.3

I1.4.3.5.2 Where a D-ATIS supplements the existing availability of Voice-ATIS and the ATIS
requires updating, Voice-ATIS and D-ATIS shall be updated simultaneously.

Note. - Guidance material relating to D-ATIS is contained in the Manual al'Air Traffic
Services Data Link Applicatians (Doc 9694). The technical requirements for the D-ATIS
application are contained in Annex 10, Volume III, Part I, Chapter 3.

11.4.3.6.5 Contents of ATIS shall be kept as brief as possible. Information additional to that
specified n 11.4.3.7 to 11"4.3.9, for example information already available in aeronautical
information publications (AIPs) and NOTAM, shall only be included when justified in
exceptional circumstances.

11.4.3.7 ATIS for arriving and departing aircraft

ATIS messages containing both arrival and departure information shall contain the following
elements of information in the order listed:

*These elements are replaced by the term "CAVOK" whenever the conditions as specified in
the MOS-ATS, Chapter 1l prevail.

tAs determined on the basis of regional air navigation agreements.

11.4.3.8 ATIS for arriving aircraft

ATIS messages containing arrival information only shall contain the following elements of
information in the order listed:

*These elements are replaced by the term "CAVOK" whenever the conditions as specified in
the MOS-ATS, Chapter 11 prevail.
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tAs determined on the basis of regional air navigational agreements.

11.4.3.9 ATIS for deparring aircraft

ATIS messages containing departure information only shall contain the following elements of
information in the order listed:

*These elements are replaced by the tenn "CAVOK", whenever the conditions as specified in
the MOS-ATS, Chapter llprevail.

tAs determined on the basis of regional air navigation

11.4.4 VOLMET broadcasts and D-VOLMET service

T1.4.1.1 HF and/or VHF VOLMET broadcasts and lor D-VOLMET service shall be provided
when it has been detennined by regional air navigation agreements that a requirement exists.

11.4.4.2 VOLMET broadcasts shall use standard radiotelephony phraseologies.

11.5 ALERTING SERVICE

11.5.1.2 Flight information centers or area control centers shall serve as the central point for
collecting all information relevant to a state of emergency of an aircraft operating within the
flight information region or control area concemed and for forwarding such information to the
appropriate rescue coordination center.

11.5.2.2.t Such part of the information specified in11.5.2.2, which is not available at the time
notification is made to a rescue coordination center, shall be sought by an air traffic services

unit prior to the declaration of a distress phase, if there is reasonable cerainty that this phase

will eventlate.

11.6 Am, TRAFFTC SERVTCES REQUTREMENTS FOR COMMTJNICATIONS

I 1.6.1 Aeronautical mobile senice (air-ground communications)

11.6.1.1 General

11.6.1.1.1 Radiotelephony and/or data link shall be used in air-ground communications for air
fraffic service purposes.

Note.- Reqairements for ATS units to be provided with and to maintain gyard on lhe

emerq:ency channel I 2 I .5 MHz are specified in CAR-ANS Parts 2 and I 3.

11.6.1.1.2 Where an RCP specification has been prescribed by States for performance-based

commtrnication, ATS units shall, in addition to the requirements specified in 11.6.1.1.1, be

provided with communication equipment which will enable thern to provide ATS in
accordance with the prescribed RCP specification(s).
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Note.- In/brmation on the performance-based communication and surveillance (PBCS)
concept and gaidance material on its implemenlation dre contained in the Pertormance-based
Communication and Surveillance (PBCS) Manual (Doc 9869).

11.6.1.1.3 When direct pilot-controller two-way radiotelephony or data link communications
are used for the provision of air traffic control service, recording facilities shall be provided on
all such air-ground comnnrnication channels.

Note.-- Requirements"for retention of all automatic recordings of communications in ATC are
specffied in LIAR-ANS Part 2, 2.6.5.1.5.

11.6.1.2.2 Whenever practicable, air-ground communication facilities for flight information
service shall permit direct, rapid, continuous and static-free two-way communications.

11.6.1.3.3 Where air-ground voice communication channels are used for area control service
and are worked by air-ground communicators, suitable arrangements shall be made to pennit
direct pilot controller voice cornmunications, as and when required.

11.6.1.5-2 Where conditions warrant, separate comrnunication channels shall be provided for
the control of traffic operating on the maneuvering area.

11.6.2 Aeronautical fixed service (ground-ground communications)

17.6.2.1General

6.2.1.1 Direct-speech andlor data link communications shall be used in ground-ground
communications for air traffic services purposes.

Note l. - Indication by time aJ'the speedwith which the communication shauld he estsblished
is provided as a guide to communication services, particularly to determine the types of
cornmunicstion channels reqaired, e.g- that "instanldneotts" ls intended to re/er to
communications which ffictively provide.for immediate access between controllers; ""fifteen

seconds" ta accept swilchbocrd operation and "five minates" lo mean metfuids involving
retransmi.vsion.

Note 2. - Requirements for relention of all autamalic recordings of cammunications in ATC
are speci{ied in CAR-ANS Part 2, 2.6.5.1.5.

11.6.?.2 Communications within a flight information region

11.6.2.2.2 Communications between air raffic services units and other units.

11.6.2.2.3.2In all cases not covered by 11.6.2.2.3.1, the communication facilities shall include
provisions for:

11.6.2.2.3.3 In all cases where automatic transfer of data to andlor from air traffic services

computers is required, suitable facilities for automatic recording shall be providd.

11.6.2.2.3.4 The commrmication facilities required in accordance with 11.6.2.2.1 and

11.6.2.2.2 shall be supplemented, as and where necessarJr, by facilities for other forms of visual
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or audio communications, for example, closed circuit television or separate information
processing systems.

11.6.2.2.3.6 The communications facilities required under 11.6.2.2.2.2 d) shall include
provisions for communications by direct speech arranged for conference communications,
whereby the communications can normally be established wittrin fifteen seconds.

11.6.2.2.3.7 All facilities for direct-speech or data link communications between air traffic
services nnits and other units described under 11.6.2.2.2.L and 1I.6.2.2.2 shalt be provided
with automatic recording.

11.6.2.3 Communications between flight information regions

11.6.2.3.1.4 The communication facilities tn 11.6.2.3.1 shall permit communications to be
established normally within fifteen seconds.

11.6.2.3.2 Adjacent ATS units shall be connected in all cases where special circumstances
exist.

11.6.2.3.3 Wherever local conditions are such that it is necessary to clear aircraft into an

adjacent control area prior to departure, an approach contol unit and/ or aerodrome control
tower shall be connected with the mea control center serving the adjacent area.

11.6.2.3.4 The communication facilities in 11.6.2.3.2 and 11.6.2.3.3 shall include provisions
for communications by direct speech alone, or in combination with data link communications,
with automatic recording, whereby for the purpose of transfer of conffol using radar or ADS-B
or ADC-daa, the communications can be established instantaneously and for other purposes

the communications can normally be established within fifteen seconds.

I T .6.2.4 Procedures for direct-speech communications

Appropriate procedures for direct-speech communications shall be developed to permit
immediate connections to be made for every urgent calls concemrng the safef of aircraft, and

the intemrption, if necessary, of less urgent calls in progress at the time.

11.63 Sur{ace movement control service

11.6.3.1.2 Where conditions warrant, separate communication channels shall be provided for
the conffol of vehicles on the maneuvering area. Automatic recording facilities shall be

provided on all such charurels.

11.6.3.1.3 Recordings of communications as required in 11.6.3.1.2 shall be retained for a

period of at least thirty days.

1,1.6.4 Aeronautical radio navigation service

11.6.4.1 Automatic recording of surveillance data

11.6.4.1.1 Surveillance data frorn prirnary and secondary radar equipment or other systems

(e.g. ADS-B, ADS-C), used as an aid to air trafflc seryices, shall be automatically recorded for
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use in accident and incident investigations, search and rescue, air traffic control and
surveillance systems evaluation and training.

11.6.4.1.2 Automatic recordings shall be retained for a period of at least ftirty days. When the
recordings are pertinent to accident and incident investigations, they shall be retained for
longer periods until it is evident that they will no longer be required.

11.7 AIR TRAFFIC SERYICES REQUIREMENTS FOR INFORMATION

11.7.1.1.1 Air traffic services units shall be supplied with up-to-date inforrnation on existing
and forecast meteorological conditions as necessary for the performance of their respective
functions. The information shall be supplied in such a forrn as to require a minimum of
interpretation on the part of air traffic services personnel and with a frequency which satisfies
the requirements of the air traffic services units concerned.

11.7 .1.1.2 Air traffic servrlces units shall be supplied with available detailed information on the
location, vertical extent, direction and rate of movement of meteorological phenomena in the
vicinity of the aerodrome, and particularly in the climb-out and approach areas, which could be
hazardous to aircraft operations.

Note. - The meteorological phenomena are listed in CAR-ANS Part 3,3.4.6.8.

11.7.1.1.3 When computer-processed upper air data are made available to air traffic services
units in digital form for use by air ffaffic services computers, the contents, format and

transmission .urangements shall be as agreed between flre Meteorological Authority and the
appropriate ATS Authority.

1 1 .7 . 1 . 1 .5 Pilot's responsibility in compliance with the Rules of the Air: Pre-flight action

11.7.1.3 Units providing approach control service

11.7.1.3.1 Units providing approach control service shall be supplied with meteorological
information as described in CAR-ANS Part 3, Appendix 3.9, 1.2 for the airspace and the
aerodromes with which they are concerned. Special reports and amendments to forecasts shall
be communicated to the units providing approach control service as soon as they are necessary

in accordance with established criteria, without waiting for the next routine report or forecast.

Where multiple anemometers are used, the indicators to which they are related shall be clearly
marked to identi$ the runway and section of the runway monitored by each anernometer.

11.7.1.3.3 Units providing approach contol service for final approach, landing and take-off
shall be equipped with surface wind indicator(s). The indicator(s) shall be related to the sarne

location(s) of observation and be fed from the same anemometer(s) as the corresponding
indicator(s) in the aerodrome control tower and in the meteorological station, where such a

station exists.

71.7 .1.3.4 Units providing approach control service for final approach, landing and take-off at

aerodromes where nrnway visual range values are assessed by instrumental means shall be

eqtupped with indicator(s) permiuing read-out ofthe current runway visual range value(s). The

indicator(s) shall be related to the same location(s) of observation and be fed from the same
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runway visual range measuring device(s) as the corresponding indicator(s) in the aerodrome
control tower and in the metmrological station, where such a station exists.

ll.7 .1.3.5 Units providing approach control service for final approach, landing and take-off at
aerodromes where the height of cloud base is assessed by instrumental means shall be
equipped with display(s) permiting read-out of the curent value(s) of the height of the cloud
base. The displays shall be related to the same location(s) of observations and be fed from the
same sensor(s) as fte c<xresponding display(s) in the aerodrome control tower and in the
meteorological station, where such a station exists.

11.7.1.3.6 Units providing approach control service for final approach, landing and take-off
shall be supplied with information on wind shear which could adversely affect aircraft on the
approach or take-offpaths or during circling approach.

Note.- Provisions concerning the issaance of'wind shear warnings and ATS requirements.for
meteorological information are given in CAR-ANS Part 3, Chapters 3.7 and 3.10, and
Appendices 3.6 and i.9.

11.7.1.4.5 Aerodrome control towers at aerodromes where the height of cloud base is assessed
by instrurnental means shall be equipped with display(s) permitting read-out of the current
value(s) of the height of cloud base. The displays shall be related to the same location(s) of
observation and be fed from the same sensor(s) as the corresponding display(s) in the
meteorological station, where such a station exists.

11.7.1.4.6 Aerodrome conffol tolyers shall be supplied with infonnation on wind shear which
could adversely affect aircraft on the approach or take-off paths or during circling approach
and aircraft on the nmway during landing roll or take-offrun.

11.7.1.4.7 Aerodrome control towers andlor other appropriate units shall be supplied with
aerodrome warnings.

Note.- The meteorolagical conditions for which aerodrome warnings are issued are listed in
CAR-ANS Part 3, Appendix 3.6, 5.1.3.

ll.T.S lnformation on the operational status of navigation services

Ll.7.3.2Information on the operational status, and any changes thereto, of radio navigation
services and visual aids as referred to in 11.7.3.1 shall be received by the appropriate ATS
unit(s) on a timely basis consistent with the use ofthe service(s) and aid(s) involved.

APPENDIX 1I.1 PRINCIPLES GOVERNING THE IDENTIFICATION OF
NAVIGATION SPECIFICATIONS AND THE IDENTIFICATION OF ATS ROUTES
OTHER THAN STAIIDARD DEPARTURE AND ARRTVAL ROUTES

(see CAR-ANS I L2, Sections I l -2.7 and ] 1.2.1 l)

11.2 Composition of designator
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11.2.1.2 The number of characters required to compose the designator shall, whenever
possible, be kept to a rnaximum of five characters.

11 .4.4 Where the leffers "F" or "G" specifie d n ll .2.4 above are used, the flight crew shall not
be required to use them in voice communications.

APPENDIX II.2. PRINCIPLES GOVERNING THE ESTABLISHMENT AND
IDENTIFTCATION OF SIGNIFICANT POINTS

ll.1 Establishment of significant points

11.1.1 Significant points shall, whenever possible, be established with reference to grormd-
based or space-based radio navigation aids, preferably VHF or higher frequency aids.

11.2 Designators for significant points marked by the site of a radio navigation aid

11.2.1.2In selecting a name for the significant point, care shall be named with reference to an
identifiable and preferably prominent geographical location.

c) the narne shall, if possible, consist of at least six letters and fonn two syllables and
preferably not more than three;

11.5 Signilicant points used for reporting purposes

11.s.4

b) the availability of a radio navigation aid at a location shall not necessarily determine its
designation as compulsoryreporting point;

c) compulsory reporting points shall not necessarily be established at flight information reglon
or control area botmdaries.

11.5.7 Routine reporting over compulsory reporting pornts shall not systematically be made
mandatory for all flights in all circumstances. In applying this principle, particular attention
shall be given to the following:

a) high-speed, high flying aircraft shall not be required to make routine position reports over all
reporting points established as compulsory for low-speed, low flying aircraft;

b) aircraft transiting through a terminal control area shall not be required to make routine
position reporls as frequently as arriving and departing aircraft.

APPENDIX 11.3. PRINCIPLES GOVERNING THE IDENTItr'ICATION OF'
STANDARD DEPARTT]RE AhID ARRTVAL ROUTES AND ASSOCIATED
PROCEDT]RES
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11.1 Designators for shndard departure and arrival routes and associated procedures

Note.- In the.fotlowing text the tetm "route" is used in the meaning a/'"roule and associated
procedures"

11.1.1 The system f designators shall:

11.3. Assignment of designators

11.3.2 To distinguish between two or more routes which relate to the same significant point
(and therefore are assigned the same basic indicator), a separate route indicator as described in
11.2.1.4 shall be assigned to each route.

lL.5 Examples of plain language and coded designators

11.5.1 .1 Meaning: The designator identifies a standard insffument departure route which
terminates at the significant point BRECON (basic indicator). BRECON is a radio navigation
facility with the identification BCN (basic indicator of the coded designator). The validity
indicator ONE (1 in the coded designator) signifies either that the original version of the route
is still in effect or that a change has been made from the previous version NINE (9) to the now
effective version ONE (l ) (see 4.3). The absence of a route indicator (see I 1.2.1.4 and I 1 .3.2)
signifies that only one route, in this case a departure route, has been established with reference
to BRECON.

ll .6.4 .2 Meaning: The designator identifies an MLS/RNAV approach procedure which begins
at the signiflcant point HAPPY (basic indicator). HAPPY is a significant point not marked by
the site of a radio navigation faciliry and therefore assigned a five-letter name-code in
accordance with Appendix 2. The validity indicator ONE (1) signifies that either the original
version of the route is still in effect or a change has been made from the previous version NINE
(9) to the now effective version ONE (1). The route indicator ALPHA (A) identifies one of
several routes established with reference to HAPPY and is a specific character assigned to this
route.

APPENDIX 1 1.6. PRESCRIPTTVE FATIGUE MANAGEMENT REGULATIONS

Note.-- Guidance on the development and implementation of prescriptive fatigte management
regplations is containetl in the Mwwal for the Oversight of Fatigue Management Approaches
(Doc 9966).

1. CAAP shall establish prescriptive limitation regulations that take into account acute and

cumulative fatigue, circadian factors and the type of work being turdertaken. These regulations

shall identifr:

a) the maximum:

i) number ofhours in any duty period;
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ii) number of consecutive work days;

iii) number of hours worked in a defined period; and

iv) time-in-position;

b) the minimum:

i) duration of non-duty periods;

ii) number of non-duty days required in a defined period; and

iii) duration of breaks between periods oftime-in-position in a duty period.

2. CAAP shall require that the air traffic services provider identifies a process for assigning
unscheduled duties that allows air traffic contollers to avoid extended periods of being awake.

3. The processes established by CAAP in accordmce with 11.2.28.3 c) and d) to allow
variations from I a) and b) above shall include the provision of:

a) the reason for the need to deviate;

b) the extent of the deviation;

c) the date and time of enactrnent of the deviation; and

d) a safety case, outlining mitigations, to support the deviation.

APPENDIX 11.8. STATE RESPONSIBILMIES CONCERNING AN INSTRUMENT
FLIGHT PROCEDURE DESIGN SERVICE

${ote.- See Chapter I1.2, I L2.33}

1. CAAP shall:

a) provide an instrument flight procedure design service; and/or

b) agree with one or more Contracting State(s) to provide a joint service; and/or

c) delegate the provision of the service to external agenry(ies).

2. In all cases in paragraph I above, the CAAP shall approve and remain responsible for all
instrument flight procdures for aerodromes and airspace under the authority of the CAAP.

3. lnstrument flight procedures shall be designed in accordance with CAAP-approved design

criteria.

4. CAAP shall ensure that an instnrment fliglrt procedtue design service provider intending to
design an instrument flight procedure for aerodromes or airspace under its authori$ meets the
requirements established by the Philippine regulatory ftamework.

Note.-{AR-ANS Part 16 provides.fbr the standards that apply for the design oJ'instrument

flight procedures within the Philippine airspace. It alsa applies to person or organization who
warul to become, {)r are, aulhorized desigyers oJ'instrument.flight procedures.
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5. The CAAP shall ensure that an instrument flight procedure design service provider utilize a
quality management system at each stage of the instrument flight procedure design proress.

Note.- This requiremenl can he mel hy means af a quality assurance methodologt, such as
that described in PANS-OPS (Doc 8168), Volume II, Part I, Section 2, Chapter 4 - Quality
Assurance. Guiclance for implementing such a methodolog,t is contained in Tbe Quality
Assurance Manual for Flight Procedure Design (Doc 9906).

6. CA.AI'} shall ensure that maintenance and periodic review of instrument flight procedures for
aerodromes and airspace under its authority are conducted. CAAP shall establish an interval
for periodic review of instrument flight procedures not exceeding five years.

Note.-- Guidance on maintenance and periodic review is contained in CAR-ANS Part 16

ATTACHMENT I1A. MATERIAL RELATING TO A METHOD OF ESTABLISHING
ATS ROUTES DEFINED BY VOR

(Chapter 11.2.7.1 arulSection tL2.1I refer)

11.2 Determination of YOR system performance values

The large variability of the values which are likely to be associated with each of the factors that
make up the total VOR system. and flre limitation of presenfly available methods to measure all
these effects individually with the required precision, have led to the conclusion that an

assessment of the total system error provides a more realistic method for detennining the VOR
system performance. The material contained in 3 and 4 should be applied only after study of
Circular 120 especially with respect to the environmental conditions.

Note.- Guidance material on overall VOR system accuracy is also contained in CAR-ANS Part
6, Attachment B.

11.3.1 For VoRdefined routes where radar or ADS-B is not used to assist aircraft in
remaining within the protected airspace, the following guidance is provided. However, when
the lateral deviations of aircraft are being controlled with the aid of radm or ADS-B
monitoring, the size of the protected airspace required may be reduced, as indicated by
practical indicated by practical experience ganed in the airspace under consideration.

11.4. Spacing of parallel routes defined by VORs

4.2Tfus spacing of parallel routes assumes:

d) no real-time radar or ADS-B monitoring or control of the lateral deviations is exercised.

ll .4.4 Application of radar or ADS-B monitoring and control of the lateral deviations of the

aircraft may have a large efect on the minimum allowable distance between routes. Studies on
the effect of radar monitoring indicate that:

According to these shrdies and taking into account the experience some States have

accumulated over many years with parallel route systems under continuous radar control, it can
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be expected that a reduction to the order of 15 to 18.5 km (8 to 10 NM), but most probably not
less than 13 km (7 NM), rnay be possible as long as radar monitoring workload is not increased
substantially by that reduction. Actual operations of such systems using reduced lateral spacing
have shown that:

- it is very important to define and publish change-over points (see aiso 6);

- large turns should be avoided when possible; and

- where large turns cannot be avoided, required turn profiles should be defined for turns
larger than 20 degrees.

Even where the probability of total radar or ADS-B failure is very small, procedures to cover
that case should be considered.

11.6 Change-over points for VORs

11.6.2 Nothing in 11.6.1 should be interpreted as placing a restriction on the service ranges of
VOR installations meeting the specifications in CAR-ANS Part 6,6.3.3.

-END-
(Amendment 508)

CAR-ANS Part 11

CHAPTER 1. DET'INITIONS

APPENDTX 11.7. FATTGUE RrSK MANAGEMENT SYSTEM (FRMS)
REQUIREMENTS

Note.- Guidance on the develapment and implementation aJ'FRMS regulations is contained in
the Manual for the Oversiglrt of Fatigue Management Approaches (Doc 9966).

CAAP shall require that an FRMS contain, at a minimum:

l. FRMS policy and documentation

1.1 FRMS policy

1.1.1 The air traffic services provider shall define its FRMS policy, with all elements of the

FRMS clearly identifi ed.

I .1.2 The policy shall:

a) define the scope of FRMS operations;

b) reflect the shared responsibility of management, air traffic controllers, and other involved
personnel;
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c) clear$ state the safety objectives ofthe FRMS;

d) be signed by the accountable executive of the organization;

e) be communicated, with visible endorsement, to all the relevant areas and levels of the
organization;

f) declare management commitment to effective safety reporting;

g) declare maoagement comrnitment to the provision of adequate resources for the FRMS;

h) declare management commitment to continuous improvement ofthe FRMS;

i) require that clear lines of accountability for management air traffic confrollers, and all other
involved personnel me identified; and

j) require periodic reviews to ensure it remains relevant and appropriate.

Note.- Effective safety reporting is described in the Safety Management Manual (SMM) (Doc
esse).

1 .2 FRMS doctrmentation

An air traffic services provider shall develop and keep current FRMS documentation that
describes and records:

a) FRMS policy and objectives;

b) FRMS processes and procedures;

c) accountabilities, responsibilities and authorities for these processes and procedures;

d) mechanisms for ongoing involvement of management, air traffic conffollers, and all other
involved personnel;

e) FRMS training prograrnmes, training requirements and affendance records;

f) scheduled and actual du5r and non-duty periods and break periods between times in position
in a duty period with significant deviations and reasons for deviations noted; and

Note. - Sigyificont deviations are described in the Manual for the Oversight of Fatigue
Management Approaches (Doc 9966).

g) FRMS outputs including findings from collected data, recommendations, and actions taken.

2. Fatigue risk management processes

2.1 Identification of fatigue-related hazards

Note.- Provisions on the prctectian of safety irq{ormation are contained in Annex 19.

An air traffic seryices provider shall develop and maintain three fundamental and documented

processes for fatigue hazard identification:

2.1.1 Predictive. The predictive process shall identify fatigue hazards by examining air traffic
conffoller scheduling and taking into account factors known to affect sleep and fatigue and

their effects on perfonnance. Methods of examination may include but are not limited to:
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a) air traffic services or industry operational experience and data collected on similar types of
operations or from other industries with shift work or 24-hour operations;

b) evidence-based scheduling practices; and

c) bio-mathematical models.

2.1.2 Proactive. Tlte proactive process shall identify fatigue hazards within crrrrent air traffic
services operations. Methods of examination may include but are not limited to:

a) self-reporting of fatigue risks;

b) fatigue surveys;

c) relevant air traffic controller performance data;

d) available safety databases and scientific studies;

e) tracking and analysis of differences in planned and actual worked times; and

f) observations during norrnal operations or qpecial evaluations.

2.1-3 Reactive. The reactive process shall identify the contribution of fatigue hazards to reports
and events associated with potential negative safety consequences in order to detefinine how
the impact of fatigue could have been minimized. At a minimum, the process may be triggered
by any of the following:

a) fatigue reports;

b) confi dential reports;

c) audit reports; and

d) incidents.

2.2 F aigae-related risk assessment

2.2.1 Atr air traffic selices provider shall develop and implement risk assessment procedures

that detennine when the associated risks require mitigation.

2.2.2 T1,rre risk assessment procedures shall review identified fatigue hazards and link them to:

a) operational processes;

b) their probability;

c) possible consequences; and

d) the effectiveness of existing preventive controls and recovery measures.

2.3 Riskmitigation

An air traffic services provider shall develop and implement fatigue risk mitigation procedures

that:

a) select the appropriate mitigation strategies;

b) implement the mitigation sfrategies; and

c) monitor the strategies' implementation and effectiveness.

69



3. FRMS safety assurance processes

The air traffic services provider shall develop and maintain FRMS safeqr assuranse processes
to:

a) provide for continuous FRMS performance monitoring, analysis of trends, and measurement
to validate the effectiveness of the frtigue safety risk conffols. The sources of data may
include, but are not limited to:

l) hazard reporting and investigations;

2) audits and surveys; and

3) reviews and fatigue studies (both internal and external);

b) provide a formal process for the management of change. This shall include but is not limited
to:

l) identification of changes in the operational environment that may aff[ect the FRMS;

2) identification of changes within the organization that may affect the FRMS; and

3) consideration of available tools which could be used to maintain or improve FRMS
performance prior to implementing changes; and

c) provide for the continuous improvement of the FRMS. This shall include but is not limited
to:

1) the elimination and/or modification of preventive controls and recovery measures that have
had unintended consequences or that are no longer needed due to changes in flre operational or
organizational environment;

2) routine evaluations of facilities, equipment, documentation and procedures; and

3) the determination of the need to introduce new processes ard procedures to mitigate
emerging fatigue-related risks.

4. FRMS promotion processes

FRMS promotion processes support the ongoing development of the FRMS, the continuous
improvement of its overall performance, and attainment of optimum safe$ levels. The
following shall be established and implernented by the air traffic service provider as part of its
FRMS:

a) training progfiunmes to ensure competency commensurate wiflr the roles and responsibilities

of management, air traffic controllers, and all other involved persorurel trnder the planned

FRMS; and

b) an effective FRMS communication plan that:

1) explains FRMS policies, procedures and responsibilities to all relevant stakeholders; and

2) describes commurication channels used to gather and disseminate FRMS-related

information.

END
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f,FFECTTVITY CLAUSE:

Fifteen (15) days after publication in a requisite single newspaper of general circulation or the
Official Gazette and a copy filed with the U.P. Law Center - Office of the National
Administative Register, this Memorandum Circular shall take effect and supersede any orders
and./or memoranda in conflict herewith.

So ordered. Signed this 12th day of May 2017, CAAP, Pasay City

CAPT
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